IN THE UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT FOR THE DISTRICT OF NEW JERSEY

C.P., individually and on behalf of F.P., a minor child; D.O. individually and on behalf of M.O., a minor child; S.B.C., individually and on behalf of C.C., a minor child; A.S., individually and on behalf of A.A.S., a minor child; M.S., individually and on behalf of her minor child, H.S.; Y.H.S., individually and on behalf of his minor child, C.H.S.; E.M. on behalf of her minor child, C.M.; M.M., individually and on behalf of K.M.; L.G., individually and on behalf of her minor child, T.M.; E.P., individually and on behalf of her minor child, Ea.P.; and on behalf of ALL OTHERS SIMILARLY SITUATED,

Plaintiffs,

v.

NEW JERSEY DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION; KEVIN DEHMER, Interim Commissioner of Education, in his official capacity,

Defendants.

N DEHMER,
of Education,

DECLARATION OF CATHERINE MERINO REISMAN IN SUPPORT OF MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES FOR REISMAN CAROLLA GRAN & ZUBA LLP

- I, Catherine Merino Reisman, hereby declare:
- 1. This declaration is based upon my personal knowledge. If called to testify, I could testify competently to the facts set forth in this declaration.

Civil Action No. 19-cv-12807

- 2. I am an attorney at law, admitted to practice in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania since 1989, the State of New Jersey since 2001, and the State of New York since 2018.
- 3. I am also admitted in the United States Supreme Court, United States Courts of Appeal for the Third, Second, Fifth, Sixth, Eighth, and Ninth Circuits, and the following United States District Courts: District of New Jersey, Eastern District of Pennsylvania, Middle District of Pennsylvania, Southern District of New York, Eastern District of New York, Northern District of New York, District of Connecticut, Southern District of Texas, and Western District of Tennessee.
- 4. I am a founding partner of Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba LLP in Haddonfield, New Jersey.
- 5. I am a 1989 graduate of Yale Law School, where I served as a Note Editor on the Yale Law Journal, a founding member of the Yale Journal of Law and Feminism, and director of the Labor Law Project and Student-Funded Fellowships. I am a 1985 *magna cum laude* graduate of New York University.
- 6. I clerked for the Honorable Edward N. Cahn, Chief Judge of the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Pennsylvania from 1990 to 1991. From 1991 to 1999, I was an Associate at Willig, Williams & Davidson in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania, where my practice concentrated on civil rights and employment discrimination matters. From 1999 to 2001, I practiced part-time,

working for myself. In 2001, I joined Montgomery McCracken Walker & Rhoads, LLP in Philadelphia, Pennsylvania.

- 7. I began practicing in the area of special education law in 1999. As an Of Counsel attorney at Montgomery McCracken, I co-chaired the Special Education practice group with one of one my current law firm partners, Amelia Carolla.
- 8. In 2008, Ms. Carolla and I launched Reisman Carolla LLP, which is now Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba LLP, where more than 90% of my practice has been in the area of representing individuals with disabilities in cases related to education and civil rights.
- 9. Since 1999, I have represented dozens of children with disabilities and their families in education law and civil rights matters involving school districts throughout New Jersey, as well as in Southeastern and Central Pennsylvania, and in other states. In connection with my representation of families, I have attended Individualized Education Program meetings, negotiated settlements with school districts, written and filed complaints for Due Process Hearings with New Jersey's Office of Administrative Law and the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania's Office for Dispute Resolution, and participated in federal court litigation and appeals. I have appeared both in state due process hearings and in federal court, including the United States District Courts for the Eastern and Middle Districts of Pennsylvania, the District of New Jersey, the District of Nevada, the District of Connecticut, the

Southern District of Texas, the District of Massachusetts, and the District of Nevada and the United States Courts of Appeals for the Third and Fifth Circuits. Some representative cases are: Sch. Dist. of Phila. v. Kirsch, 722 F. App'x 215 (3d Cir. 2018); J.F., et al. v. S. Orange Maplewood Bd. of Educ., No. 19-2629 (3d Cir.); Lauren W. v. DeFlaminis, 480 F.3d 259 (3d Cir. 2007); S.D. v. Haddon Heights Bd. of Educ., 833 F.3d 389 (3d Cir. 2016), vacated and remanded by 137 S. Ct. 2121 (2017), on remand, 722 F. App'x 119 (3d Cir. 2018); Cent. Bucks Sch. Dist. v. Q.M., No. 22-cv-1128, 2022 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 215318 (E.D. Pa. Sept. 12, 2022); Victoria S. v. Montgomery Cnty. Intermediate Unit, No. 22-cv-4858 (E.D. Pa. 2022); Rogich v. Clark Cnty. Sch. Dist., No. 17-cv-1541, 2021 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 197135 (D. Nev. Oct. 12, 2021); C.P. v. N.J. Dep't of Educ., No. 19-12807, 2022 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 158147 (D.N.J. Sept. 1, 2022); K.N. v. Gloucester City Bd. of Educ., 379 F. Supp. 3d 334 (D.N.J. 2019); Doe v. Westport Bd. of Educ., No. 18-cv-1683, 2020 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 202598 (D. Conn. Oct. 30, 2020); E.P. v. N. Arlington Bd. of Educ., No. 17-8195, 2019 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 55443 (D.N.J. Apr. 1, 2019); F.J., individually & o/b/o T.J. v. Education Plus Academy Charter Sch., No. 13-5026 (E.D. Pa. 2013); D.V. v. Pennsauken Sch. Dist., 247 F. Supp. 3d 464 (D.N.J. 2017); R.H. v. Bd. of Educ., 776 F. App'x 719 (2d Cir. 2019); G.M. v. Brigantine Pub. Sch., No. 14-4606, 2015 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 73640 (D.N.J. June 8, 2015); H.H. et al. v. Pine Hill Bd. of Educ. No. 17-5300 (D.N.J.); L.G. v. Winslow Twp. Bd. of Educ., No. 11-cv-2285

- (D.N.J.). The following cases provide a sampling of administrative hearings I have handled: *J.F. & D.J. o/b/o J.F. v. South Orange Maplewood Bd. of Educ.*, OAL Dkt. No. EDS 08155-18 (NJ May 22, 2019); *T.R. & P.R. o/b/o D.R. v. Matawan-Aberdeen Reg'l Bd. of Educ.*, OAL Dkt. No. EDS 06170-15 (NJ Aug. 30, 2016); *P.A. v. Pennsbury Sch. Dist.*, ODR No. 15270-1415AS (PA March 2, 2015); *T.J. v. Educ. Plus Acad. Cyber Charter Sch.*, ODR No. 13941-1213KE (PA Aug. 23, 2013); *M.J. v. West Chester Area Sch. Dist.*, ODR No. 01634-10-11 (PA Mar. 15, 2011); *M.M. v. Rose Tree Media Sch. Dist.*, ODR No. 01394-10-11 (PA Dec. 5, 2010); *K.S. v. Wallingford-Swarthmore Sch. Dist.*, ODR No. 00579-09-10 (PA Aug. 30, 2010); *M.C. v. Wallingford-Swarthmore Sch. Dist.*, ODR No. 9882-08-09 (PA Dec. 10, 2009).
- 10. I am active in the Council of Parent Attorneys and Advocates (COPAA), www.copaa.org, a national non-profit 501(c)(3) organization of attorneys, advocates, and parents dedicated to protecting the special education and civil rights of children with disabilities throughout the United States. I was a member of the COPAA Board of Directors from 2008-2021. From 2011-2012, I was Chair of the COPAA Board, from 2010-2011, I was Vice Chair, and from 2009-2010, I was Treasurer.
- 11. I have represented COPAA as an *amicus curiae* in the Supreme Court in *Perez v. Sturgis Pub. Schs.*, 143 S. Ct. 859 (2023); *Endrew F. v. Douglas County*

Sch. Dist. RE-1, 580 U.S. 386 (2017); Fry v. Napoleon Community Sch., 580 U.S. 154 (2017); and CVS Pharmacy, Inc. v. Doe, No. 20-1374 (2021). I have also represented COPAA in the following cases: J.W. v. Paley, 81 F.4th 440 (5th Cir. 2023); Ho v. Lower Merion Sch. Dist., No. 23-1259 (3d Cir. 2023); Sutton v. Plainfield Bd. of Educ., No. 22-2062 (3d Cir. 2023); LePape v. Lower Merion Sch. Dist., No. 22-2931 (3d Cir. 2023); Osseo Area Schs., ISD 279 v. A.J.T., No. 22-3137 (8th Cir. 2023); A.J.T. v. Osseo Area Schs., ISD 279, No. 23-1399 (8th Cir. 2023); Minnetonka Pub. Schs. v. M.L.K., 42 F.4th 847 (8th Cir. 2022); Ogden v. Belton Sch. Dist., 40 F.4th 887 (8th Cir. 2022); T.R. v. Sch. Dist. of Phila., 4 F.4th 179 (3d Cir. 2021); Perez v. Sturgis Pub. Schs., 3 F.4th 236 (6th Cir. 2021); Amanda P. v. Copperas Cove Indep. Sch. Dist., 838 F. App'x 104 (5th Cir. 2021); Richardson v. Omaha Sch. Dist., 957 F.3d 869 (8th Cir. 2020); D.S. v. Trumbull Bd. of Educ., 975 F.3d 152 (2d Cir. 2020); L.R. v. Camden City Pub. Sch. Dist., 238 N.J. 547 (2019); Indep. Sch. Dist. No. 283 v. E.M.D.H., 960 F.3d 1073 (8th Cir. 2020); Richardson v. Omaha Sch. Dist., 957 F.3d 869 (8th Cir. 2020); A.A. v. Northside Indep. Sch. Dist., 951 F.3d 678 (5th Cir. 2020); Butte Sch. Dist. No. 1 v. C.S., 817 Fed. Appx. 321 (8th Cir. 2020); A.L. v. Clovis Unified Sch. Dist., 798 F. App'x 163 (9th Cir. 2020); Rena C. v. Colonial Sch. Dist., 890 F.3d 404 (3d Cir. 2018); M.S. v. Hillsborough Twp. Pub. Sch. Dist., 793 F. App'x 91 (3d Cir. 2019); M.S. v. L.A. Unified Sch. Dist., 913 F.3d 119 (9th Cir. 2019); Lejeune G. v. Khepera Charter Sch., et al., 779 F. App'x

984 (3d Cir. 2019); W.A. v. Hendrick Hudson Cent. Sch. Dist., 927 F.3d 126 (2d Cir. 2019); F.C. v. Tenn. Dep't of Educ., 745 F. App'x 605 (6th Cir. 2018); Soto v. Clark Cntv. Sch. Dist., 744 F. App'x 529 (9th Cir. 2018); Bd. of Educ. v. C.M., 744 F. App'x 7 (2d Cir. 2018); J.K. v. Missoula Cntv. Pub. Sch., 813 F. App'x 666 (9th Cir. 2018); Quatro v. Tehachapi Unified Sch. Dist., 742 F. App'x 340 (9th Cir. 2018); Dallas Indep. Sch. Dist. v. Woody, 865 F.3d 303 (5th Cir. 2017); D.G. v. New Caney Indep. Sch. Dist., 806 F.3d 310 (5th Cir. 2015); Nicole B. v. Sch. Dist. of Phila., 237 A.3d 986 (Pa. 2020). In my capacity as co-chair of the Amicus Committee, I have participated in the drafting and filing of amicus briefs in the following cases: Espinoza v. Montana Dept. of Revenue, 140 S. Ct. 2246 (2020); Los Angeles Unified Sch. Dist. v. A.O., F.4th , 2024 U.S. App. LEXIS 3550 (9th Cir. Feb. 15, 2024); Lartigue v. Northside Indep. Sch. Dist., 86 F.4 689 (5th Cir. 2023); Z.Q. v. New York City Dept. of Educ., 2023 U.S. App. LEXIS 2733 (2d Cir. Feb. 3, 2023); E.T. v. Paxton, 41 F.4th 709 (5th Cir. 2022); Doe v. Portland Pub. Sch., 30 F.4th 85 (1st Cir. 2022); Capistrano Unified Sch. Dist. v. S.W., 21 F.4th 1125 (9th Cir. 2021); S.C. v. Lincoln Cnty. Sch. Dist., 16 F.4th 587 (9th Cir. 2021); P.S. v. Pleasantville Union Free Sch. Dist., 168 A.D.3d 853 (N.Y. App. Div. 2019); Anchorage Sch. Dist. v. M.G., 735 F. App'x 441 (9th Cir. 2018); L.H. v. Hamilton Cnty. Bd. of Educ., 900 F.3d 779 (6th Cir. 2018); Krawietz v. Galveston Indep. Sch. Dist., 900 F.3d 673 (5th Cir. 2018); S.P. v. E. Whittier City Sch. Dist., 735 F. App'x 320 (9th Cir. 2018); T.B.

v. Prince George's Cnty. Bd. of Educ., 897 F.3d 566 (4th Cir. 2018); J.M. v. Matayoshi, 729 F. App'x 585 (9th Cir. 2018); I.Z.M. v. Rosemount-Apple Vallev-Eagen Pub. Sch., 863 F.3d 966 (8th Cir. 2017); Doe v. Cape Elizabeth Sch. Dist., 832 F.3d 69 (1st Cir. 2016); In re Expulsion of A.D., 883 N.W.2d 251 (Minn. 2016); Timothy O. v. Paso Robles Sch. Dist., 822 F.3d 1105 (9th Cir. 2016); L.O. v. N.Y.C. Dep't of Educ., 822 F.3d 95 (2d Cir. 2016); Se.H. v. Bd. of Educ. of Anne Arundel Cnty. Sch., 647 F. App'x 242 (4th Cir. 2016); B.D. v. Dist. of Columbia, 817 F.3d 792 (D.C. Cir. 2016); A.G. v. Paradise Valley Unified Sch. Dist., 815 F.3d 1195 (9th Cir. 2016); Seth B. v. Orleans Parish Sch. Bd., 810 F.3d 961 (6th Cir. 2016); S.B. v. Bd. of Educ., 819 F.3d 69 (4th Cir. 2016); S.M. v. Gwinnett County Sch. Dist., 646 F. App'x 743 (11th Cir. 2016); *Price v. Dist. of Columbia*, 792 F.3d 112 (D.C. Cir. 2015); D.A. v. Meridian Jt. Sch. Dist. No. 2, 618 F. App'x 891 (9th Cir. 2015); T.F. v. Fox Chapel Sch. Dist., 589 F. App'x 594 (3d Cir. 2014); K.M. v. Tustin Unified Sch. Dist., 726 F.3d 1088 (9th Cir. 2013; J.T. v. Dumont Pub. Sch., 533 F. App'x 44 (3d Cir. 2013); Long v. Murray County Sch. Dist., 522 F. App'x 576 (11th Cir. 2013); Anchorage Sch. Dist. v. M.P., 698 F.3d 1047 (9th Cir. 2012); Phillip C. v. Jefferson County Bd. of Educ., 701 F.3d 691 (11th Cir. 2012); Dowler v. Clover Park Sch. Dist., 258 P.3d 676 (Wash. 2011); A.M. v. Monrovia Unified Sch. Dist., 627 F.3d 773 (9th Cir. 2010); T.W. v. Sch. Bd., 610 F.3d 588 (11th Cir. 2010); Richardson Indep. Sch. Dist. v. Michael Z., 580 F.3d 286 (5th Cir. 2009).

- 12. I speak regularly to groups of parents and attorneys regarding special education and the civil rights of individuals with disabilities. With the exception of 2021, I have presented at the COPAA national conference every year since 2008. I present annually for COPAA's new attorney training program. These presentations included the following topics: Section 504 and the ADA, litigating federal court special education appeals, transition planning under IDEA, legal issues relating to harassment and bullying, cross-examination of expert witnesses, planning direct and cross-examination in special education hearings, the impact of Endrew F. on litigation of special education cases, and exhaustion issues after Fry v. Napoleon and Perez v. Sturgis Public Schools. I have presented at the Lehigh Special Education Conference, the Pennsylvania Bar Association's Exceptional Children's Conference, New Jersey Institute for Continuing Legal Education, and to parent groups on extended school year and day services, charter schools and IDEA responsibilities, related services available under IDEA, rights under IDEA and Section 504/ADA, and persistent school non-attendance issues.
- 13. Judith A. Gran was admitted to practice in the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania in 1983. She has also been admitted to practice in the United States Courts of Appeals for the Third, Fifth, Sixth, Eighth, Ninth Circuits, Tenth and Eleventh Circuits, the Eastern District of Pennsylvania, the Middle District of Pennsylvania, the Southern District of Texas, and the Western District of Tennessee.

She has practiced *pro hac vice* in a number of other jurisdictions, including representing numerous families in the New Jersey Office of Administrative Law and the United States District Court for the District of New Jersey. She has also been admitted *pro hac vice* in numerous district courts, including the District of Connecticut, the District of Minnesota, the District of Montana, the District of Northern Illinois, the District of Northern California, the Middle District of Tennessee, the Northern District of Virginia, the Northern District of Oklahoma, the District of New Mexico, the Eastern District of Missouri and the Northern District of Oklahoma.

- 14. Ms. Gran graduated *cum laude* from Temple Law School in 1983. She served on the staff of the Temple Law Quarterly. She has a master's degree from the University of Chicago in Political Science and a bachelor of arts degree, with honors, from Wellesley College. She specializes in litigation on behalf of children and adults with disabilities, including the area of special education.
- 15. Before joining Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba LLP, Ms. Gran was a staff attorney at the Public Interest Law Center of Philadelphia (PILCOP), where she served as Director of Disability Projects. She has practiced disability rights law for more than 38 years.
- 16. Ms. Gran has represented hundreds of special education students in administrative and judicial proceedings in Pennsylvania, New Jersey and other

states, including Virginia, West Virginia, Minnesota, Missouri, Oklahoma, Colorado and Tennessee. She served as lead counsel in the class action suit Gaskin v. Commonwealth of Pennsylvania, No. 94-4048 (E.D. Pa.), a case brought to enforce the least restrictive environment mandate of the Individuals with Disabilities Education Act that resulted in a settlement agreement implemented throughout the Commonwealth of Pennsylvania. She has conducted class action litigation to obtain institutionalized persons with intellectual community services for developmental disabilities in Pennsylvania, Connecticut, Oklahoma, New Mexico, Montana, California, Illinois and Tennessee. She served as counsel for the Arc of Pennsylvania and the plaintiff class during the implementation phase of the consent decree in Halderman v. Pennhurst, No. 74-1345, from 1984 to 1998. In each of these cases, she had responsibility for all aspects of litigation, including drafting pleadings, conducting discovery, trial, post-trial proceedings and enforcement, and appeals.

17. She was one of the founding members of COPAA. She served on the COPAA national board from 1998 to 2009 and served as its chair for two terms, from 2002 to 2004. She received COPAA's highest award, the Diane Lipton Award for Outstanding Educational Advocacy, in 2009. She has presented a plenary session on the year's decisions in the Courts of Appeals at every one of COPAA's annual conferences since 1999. She presents regularly to parents, attorneys, professionals and others at conferences and Continuing Legal Education events.

18. In 2023, Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba's customary billing rates, based on current community market rates, were:

Judith A. Gran (J.D. 1983)	\$ 610
Catherine Merino Reisman (J.D. 1989)	\$ 585
Amelia Carolla (J.D. 1995)	\$ 540
Sarah E. Zuba (J.D. 2002)	\$ 475

19. In 2024, Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba's customary billing rates, based on current community market rates, are:

Judith A. Gran (J.D. 1983)	\$ 630
Catherine Merino Reisman (J.D. 1989)	\$ 600
Amelia Carolla (J.D. 1995)	\$ 560
Sarah E. Zuba (J.D. 2002)	\$ 500

20. In *K.N. v. Gloucester City Bd. of Educ.*, No. 17-7976, 2022 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 36492 (D.N.J. March 1, 2022), this Court found that my 2021 hourly rate of \$ 545 per hour was a reasonable rate for the relevant legal market, the Philadelphia Metropolitan Area. *Id.* at *6 & n.3. The Court also held that a 4-5% annual increase in rates is appropriate. *Id.* at *8. My 2023 rate of \$ 585 per hour is consistent with a 4% annual increase from my 2021 rate approved in *K.N.*

- 21. In 2022, Judge Kearney of the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Pennsylvania approved an hourly rate of \$ 590 for Ms. Gran and \$ 565 for me for work performed in 2022. (The school district did not contest the reasonableness of those hourly rates.) *See Cent. Bucks Sch. Dist. v. Q.M.*, No. 22-1128, 2022 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 215318 (E.D. Pa. 2022). Our current billing rates are consistent with a 4% annual increase of the rates approved in *Q.M.* The rates for myself and Ms. Gran are also consistent with a 4% annual increase from 2020 rates approved by the Court in *E.H. v. Wissahickon Sch. Dist.*, No. 2:19-cv-05445, 2020 U.S. Dist. LEXIS 199469, at *11 (E.D. Pa. Oct. 27, 2020): \$ 525 for me and \$ 550 for Ms. Gran.
- 22. During this litigation, RCGZ timekeepers kept contemporaneous records in our practice management system documenting professional time spent and out-of-pocket costs incurred. The billing reports attached to this Declaration were created by exporting the information maintained in our practice management system.
- 23. The billing reports for my time through are attached hereto as Exhibit 1. Although my billing rate increased to \$ 600 per hour for 2024, we have used the rate of \$ 585 per hour that was used during the settlement negotiations. During this representation, through

February 29, 2024, I billed a total of 1354 hours, broken down by month and year, as follows:

MONTH & YEAR	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
July 2019	585	.6	351.00
August 2019	585	1.0	585.00
October 2019	585	2.7	1579.50
November 2019	585	2.5	1462.50
December 2019	585	.3	175.50
January 2020	585	5.4	3159.00
February 2020	585	49.4	28899.00
March 2020	585	1.6	936.00
May 2020	585	6.0	3510.00
June 2020	585	8.0	4680.00
July 2020	585	1.0	585.00
October 2020	585	1.0	585.00
November 2020	585	.5	292.50
December 2020	585	7.7	4504.50
January 2021	585	2.7	1579.50
February 2021	585	13.1	7663.50
March 2021	585	13.6	7956.00
June 2021	585	1.6	936.00
July 2021	585	30.2	17667.00
August 2021	585	51.7	30244.50
September 2021	585	113	66105.00
October 2021	585	29.5	17257.50
November 2021	585	90.3	52825.50
December 2021	585	109.4	63999.00
January 2022	585	133.3	77980.50
February 2022	585	137	80145.00
March 2022	585	7.9	4621.50
April 2022	585	37.1	21703.50
May 2022	585	33.7	19714.50
June 2022	585	25.5	14917.50
July 2022	585	10.5	6142.50
August 2022	585	29.6	17316.00
September 2022	585	97.5	57037.50

MONTH & YEAR	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
October 2022	585	37.2	21762.00
November 2022	585	36.9	21586.50
December 2022	585	27.8	16263.00
January 2023	585	13.1	7663.50
February 2023	585	23.8	13923.00
March 2023	585	39.4	23049.00
April 2023	585	8.7	5089.50
May 2023	585	17.4	10179.00
June 2023	585	4.9	2866.50
July 2023	585	7.0	4095.00
August 2023	585	5.5	3217.50
September 2023	585	12.6	7371.00
October 2023	585	15.5	9067.50
November 2023	585	10.1	5908.50
December 2023	585	12.2	7137.00
January 2024	585	6.7	3919.50
February 2024	585	20.3	11875.50
		1354	792,090.00

The billing report reflects a total of \$ 792,495.00 because it has the \$ 600 hourly rate for January and February 2024. For purposes of the fee petition, we are using the 2023 hourly rate, so the total for my time is \$ 792,090.00.

24. Ms. Gran's billing reports are attached as Exhibit 2. Although her billing rate increased to \$ 630 per hour for 2024, we have used the rate of \$ 610 per hour that was used during the settlement negotiations and that is the rate for purpose of this fee petition. She billed a total of 77.1 hours, broken down by month and year as follows:

MONTH & YEAR	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
April 2020	610	.8	488.00
June 2020	610	1.3	793.00
September 2020	610	.7	427.00
December 2020	610	1.7	1037.00
March 2021	610	.3	183.00
September 2021	610	24.7	15067.00
October 2021	610	12.0	7320.00
November 2021	610	.1	61.00
December 2021	610	.2	122.00
January 2022	610	.5	305.00
January 2023	610	1.7	1037.00
February 2023	610	11.7	7137.00
March 2023	610	3.3	2013.00
April 2023	610	4.2	2562.00
May 2023	610	.5	305.00
June 2023	610	1.3	793.00
August 2023	610	5.0	3050.00
September 2023	610	1.9	1159.00
October 2023	610	3.0	1830.00
February 2024	610	2.2	1342.00
		77.1	47,031.00

The billing report reflects a total of \$ 47,075.00 because it has the \$ 630 hourly rate for January and February 2024. For purposes of the fee petition, we are using the 2023 hourly rate, so the total for Ms. Gran's time is \$ 47,031.00.

25. Tina Tilton's billing reports are attached as Exhibit 3. She billed a total of 8.6 hours, broken down by month and year as follows:

MONTH & YEAR	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
January 2022	125	6.0	750.00
September 2022	125	.5	62.50
February 2023	125	1.3	162.50
January 2024	125	.8	100.00
		8.6	1075.00

26. Connie Tracey's billing reports are attached as Exhibit 4. She billed a total of 3.0 hours, broken down by month and year as follows:

MONTH & YEAR	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
November 2021	125	3.0	375.00
December 2023	125	1.4	175.00
		4.4	550.00

- 27. Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba incurred expenses of \$4,945.88 in this matter, as reflected in Exhibit 5.
- 28. The total lodestar for Reisman Carolla Gran & Zuba is \$ 845,391.88 for 1445.8 hours, calculated as follows:

	RATE	HOURS	TOTAL
Catherine Merino Reisman	585	1354	792,090.00
Judith A. Gran	610	77.1	47,031.00
Tina Tilton	125	10.3	1,075.00
Connie Tracey	125	4.4	250.00
Total Hours		1445.8	840,446.00
Expenses			4,945.88
			845,391.88

Pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed on March 5, 2024

/s/ Catherine Merino Reisman Catherine Merino Reisman

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 19 of 162 PageID: 16562

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
07/05/2019	4	Reviewing letter filed by K. Soranno re request for additional time to answer or otherwise plead Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
07/29/2019	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re negotiations with DOE re preliminary procedural issues and proposed CMO Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
07/30/2019	②	Reviewing emails from co-counsel re case management activities Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
08/13/2019	•	Conference call regarding motion to dismiss and other issues Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
10/17/2019	②	Participate in conference call with co-counsel re PI briefing Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
10/23/2019	4	Drafting and revising inserts for certification re p.i. motion Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 20 of 162 PageID: 16563

Activities Export

	-				2.	D ((2)		B
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
11/11/2019	0	Conducting legal research and revising section of motion to dismiss opposition brief on declaratory judgment Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
11/21/2019	•	Reviewing reply re class cert motion and drafting email to cocounsel re same (1.2); reviewing reply re preliminary injunction and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.5) Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
12/15/2019	②	Reviewing and revising letter from J. Rue re amicus filing Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
01/08/2020	②	Reviewing correspondence to court re oral argument Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
01/21/2020	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re new guidelines/TRO (.6); conducting legal research re same (1.4) Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
01/22/2020	4	Drafting email to T. O'Leary re TRO/PI Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 21 of 162 PageID: 16564

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
01/23/2020	4	Conducting legal research for and drafting portion of section of brief re injunctive relief standards and drafting emails to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
01/25/2020	4	Reviewing and revising brief in support of injunctive relief, conducting legal research re same, and drafting emails to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
01/27/2020	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re brief in support of TRO/PI and conducting legal research re same Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
01/28/2020	②	Reviewing emails from J. Rue re TRO/PI hearing and drafting response Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
02/11/2020	4	Review of DOE opposition to PI motion and telephone cal with J. Rue re reply Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
02/13/2020	②	Reviewing defendants' opposition to PI motion and drafting portion of	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	3.50h	\$585.00	-	\$2,047.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 22 of 162 PageID: 16565

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		reply, conducting legal research re same Billed invoice 20200186	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
02/18/2020	4	Meeting with co-counsel in preparation for argument (3.2); travel to/from and attending argument on motion to dismiss and injunction motions in Camden (5.3) Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.50h	\$585.00	-	\$4,972.50
02/19/2020	②	Telephone conference with co- counsel re Second Amended Complaint Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
02/20/2020	②	Conducting legal research for and drafting Second Amended Complaint Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
02/22/2020	②	Conducting legal research for and revising Second Amended Complaint Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
02/23/2020	②	Conducting legal research, drafting and revising Second Amended Complaint, telephone call with J. Rue re same, drafting email to client re same Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.10h	\$585.00	-	\$5,908.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 23 of 162 PageID: 16566

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
02/28/2020	4	Draft email to T. O'Leary re second PI motion and review response Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
02/26/2020	4	Telephone conference with J. Rue and T. O'Leary re second PI motion Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
02/25/2020	4	Drafting supplemental letter brief re motion to dismiss and PI motion (4.8); drafting email to T. O'Leary re same (.2) Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,925.00
02/25/2020	②	Conducting legal research for, reviewing records and revising Second Amended Complaint and telephone conferences with cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.50h	\$585.00	-	\$3,217.50
02/24/2020	②	Conducting legal research for supplemental memorandum of law in support of revised motion for preliminary injunction Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
02/24/2020	②	Conducting legal research and revising Second Amended Complaint and communications with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/28/2020	②	Drafting and reviewing emails re correspondence from K. Soranno (.3); telephone conferences with co-counsel re same (.6) Billed invoice 20200186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
03/01/2020	4	Reviewing emails from court, K. Soranno, and J. Rue re adjournment Billed invoice 20200227	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
03/04/2020	4	Revising brief re second PI motion and drafting email to T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20200227	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
03/10/2020	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re next motion to dismiss and motion to certify class and drafting response (.2); telephone call with S. Zuba re clients with comp ed claims (.3) telephone call with cocounsel re potential correspondence to court and revised proposed order and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.5) Billed invoice 20200227	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
03/25/2020	4	Drafting email to co-counsel regarding status of guidelines/ second PI Billed invoice 20200227	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
05/22/2020	4	Reviewing decision on motion to dismiss and conferring with cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20200399	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
05/26/2020	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re next steps (.4); conference call with cocursel re next steps and response to text order re consolidation of PI with trial on merits (.8); follow-up call with J. Rue re discovery requests and email to J. Rue and J. Gran re same (.2); drafting proposed discovery requests and reviewing comments of co-counsel (.9) Billed invoice 20200399	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	_	\$1,345.50
05/27/2020	4	Telephone call with J. Rue and responding to email re joint letter to court (.1); reviewing email from J. Rue re discovery plan and drafting response (.1) Billed invoice 20200399	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
05/28/2020	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re renewed motion for class certification, discovery issues, strategy re violations in OAL (.8); reviewing emails re discovery, class certification, potential withdrawal of second motion for pi (.4); revising proposed Joint Discovery Plan and stipulation re ESI (1.0); drafting email to T. O'Leary re comp ed claims (.1);	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 26 of 162 PageID: 16569

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		telephone calls with J. Rue re correspondence to Court re pi and class certification motions and reviewing correspondence (.1) Billed invoice 20200399						
05/29/2020	②	Reviewing NJDOE's filing with court re p.i. and scheduling issues Billed invoice 20200399	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
06/05/2020	9	Reviewing email from and telephone call with J. Rue re renewed motion for class certification and related research Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
06/05/2020	4	Research related to waiver and estoppel issues re renewed motion for class certification and drafting email to J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
06/10/2020	4	Conducting research re ESI protocols Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
06/16/2020	4	Reviewing emails re recent 45 day violations Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 27 of 162 PageID: 16570

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
07/05/2020	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re class cert issues	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	0.20h	\$585.00	<u>-</u>	\$117.00
07/02/2020	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re discovery and strategy (.3); reviewing brief and letter filed by defendants related to consolidation and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same (.5) Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
06/26/2020	4	Exchanging emails with J. Rue re discovery plan and reviewing plan Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
06/24/2020	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re Rule 26 plan, discovery issues and strategy, disclosures (1.0); exchanging emails with co-counsel re expedited scheduling issues (.5) Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
06/23/2020	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re discovery and strategy issues and reviewing ESI protocol Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
06/22/2020	②	Telephone calls with J. Rue re drafting discovery plan and preparing draft plan and drafting email to co-counsel re strategy and discovery plan Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.60h	\$585.00	-	\$1,521.00
Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 28 of 162 PageID: 16571

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20200574	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
10/16/2020	②	Telephone call with J. Rue and J. Gran re strategies and next steps in litigation Billed invoice 20200890	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
11/30/2020	•	Telephone conference with co- counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20200973	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
12/01/2020	4	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re 26(f) meeting and potential settlement discussions Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
12/03/2020	4	Drafting email to E.P. re case update and discovery Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
12/12/2020	②	Telephone call re Rule 26 disclosures and joint discovery plan and drafting chart to go with plan to court (2.0); reviewing emails from and drafting emails to co-counsel re same (.5) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 29 of 162 PageID: 16572

Activities Export

Date •	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/13/2020	4	Reviewing emails re discovery issues and drafting responses Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
12/17/2020	•	Telephone conf with co-counsel re prep for rule 16 conference (.5); Rule 16 conf and conf call with counsel after Rule 16 conference (1.5) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
12/19/2020	②	Drafting list of subjects for 30b6 deposition and email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
12/22/2020	•	Reviewing draft discovery requests and drafting email re same (.8); reviewing and responding to email re consent order (.4) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
01/19/2021	0	Exchanging emails with E.P. re discovery requests Billed invoice 20210122	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
01/24/2021	0	Revising E.P. interrogatory responses Billed invoice 20210122	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 30 of 162 PageID: 16573

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/02/2021	4	Revising interrogatory responses for E.P, and drafting email to E.P. re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
02/03/2021	4	Finalizing interrogatory responses and drafting emails to E.P. and cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,638.00
02/09/2021	②	Exchanging emails with E.P. re email production Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
02/17/2021	4	Reviewing defendants' discovery responses and deficiency letter and drafting email to T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
02/22/2021	②	Working on document production of E.P. emails Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
02/24/2021	②	Reviewing subpoena topics and drafting email to T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 31 of 162 PageID: 16574

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/25/2021	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re legal research for class action and conducting research re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
02/26/2021	•	Conducting research on fees and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	<u>-</u>	\$1,579.50
03/01/2021	•	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
03/02/2021	•	Reviewing and responding to emails from co-counsel re deliberative process privilege Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
03/03/2021	•	Conducting legal research and drafting memo on deliberative process privilege Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
03/04/2021	•	Finalizing memo on deliberative process privilege and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
03/08/2021	a	Reviewing letter from T. O'Leary to	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
-					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 32 of 162 PageID: 16575

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
06/08/2021	4	Reviewing email from T. O'Leary and draft of letter re discovery and responding to email with comments Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
03/26/2021	4	Reviewing and revising brief on deliberative process privilege Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
03/22/2021	4	Reviewing email from T. O'Leary re case sampling Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
03/10/2021	4	Attendance at C. Anthony deposition and conferring with cocunsel Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
03/09/2021	②	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re C. Anthony deposition Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
		Judge Williams and reviewing letter from K. Soranno to Judge Williams re discovery issues (.2); reviewing plaintiffs' supplemental productions (1.0) Billed invoice 20210501	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
06/28/2021	②	Meeting with co-counsel re discovery, pre-trial, and trial issues Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
06/30/2021	•	Reviewing correspondence relating to discovery disputes and providing feedback to co-counsel (.2); drafting email to client re trial date and deposition (.1); drafting email to T. O'Leary re depositions (.1) Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
07/12/2021	4	Reviewing emails from co-counsel and correspondence from opposing counsel re discovery issues (.1); reviewing email from E. P. re deposition scheduling and drafting response (.1) Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
07/13/2021	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
07/19/2021	②	Telephone call with J. Rue, legal research, and emails to co-counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
07/20/2021	4	Telephone conference with co- counsel re upcoming conference	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		with court Billed invoice 20210597	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
07/21/2021	4	Participation in conference call with court and with co-counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
07/25/2021	②	Reviewing and revising letter to court re adjournment of trial date, depositions, and discovery issues and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.5); preparation for and participation in phone call with co-counsel re discovery issues and trial preparation (1.0) Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
07/25/2021	4	Reviewing discovery responses for preparation of PTO Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
07/26/2021	②	Telephone calls with co-counsel and with court regarding discovery issues; drafting email to co-counsel re same (1.4); drafting email to T. O'Leary re E.P. deposition (.1); Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
07/26/2021	4	Drafting email to J. Rue re PTO Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

								11.21 0111
Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
07/27/2021	4	Exchanging email with co-counsel re depositions and discovery issues Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
07/27/2021	a	Reviewing documents for draft of PTO Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
07/28/2021	4	Travel to/from Princeton (D. Dwyer's office) and attendance at deposition of L. Sanders Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.40h	\$585.00	-	\$5,499.00
07/29/2021	②	Reviewing documents and drafting PTO Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
07/30/2021	②	Telephone call with co-counsel and exchanging emails with E.P. re E.P. deposition and reviewing documents in preparation for deposition Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
07/30/2021	4	Reviewing documents for preparation of PTO	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 36 of 162 PageID: 16579

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20210597	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
08/01/2021	4	Preparing for E.P. deposition Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
08/01/2021	4	Reviewing documents for PTO Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
08/02/2021	②	Preparing for E. Perry deposition Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
08/02/2021	②	Reviewing discovery and drafting PTO Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,925.00
08/03/2021	②	Reviewing documents and drafting/revising pretrial order Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.10h	\$585.00	-	\$3,568.50
08/03/2021	②	Preparing E.P. for deposition Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
					1,354.00h	\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h	

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 37 of 162 PageID: 16580

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
08/04/2021	4	Reviewing documents and drafting PTO Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
08/04/2021	②	Drafting and sending email re production of document for E.P. deposition Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
08/05/2021	4	Preparing for and attending deposition of E. Perry and conferring with D. Soutar and E. Perry re same Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.00h	\$585.00	-	\$4,095.00
08/16/2021	4	Reviewing and responding to emails from co-counsel re discovery Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
08/18/2021	•	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/18/2021	•	Telephone call with J. Rue re draft PTO Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 38 of 162 PageID: 16581

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/23/2021	4	Reviewing discovery materials and drafting pretrial order (exhibits and stipulations re C.P.) Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,855.50
08/23/2021	②	Conference with co-counsel re trial prep, witnesses, remaining discovery Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
08/24/2021	4	Reviewing discovery materials and drafting PTO exhibits and stipulations re A.S. Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
08/24/2021	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re supplementing interrogatory responses with potential additional witness and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
08/24/2021	②	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery motion re instructions not to answer Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/26/2021	4	Reviewing discovery and drafting PTO (plaintiffs exhibits and stipulations) Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,685.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 39 of 162 PageID: 16582

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
09/03/2021	4	Reviewing emails from co-counsel	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
09/02/2021	a	Attending discovery motion hearing and conferring with co-counsel Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
09/02/2021	4	Reviewing discovery, drafting and revising PTO Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.20h	\$585.00	-	\$3,627.00
09/01/2021	a	Reviewing discovery and depositions and drafting PTO Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.80h	\$585.00	-	\$3,978.00
09/01/2021	a	Telephone call with co-counsel re discovery/trial issues Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
08/31/2021	a	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
08/30/2021	②	Telephone status conferences with co-counsel (2) Billed invoice 20210649	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		re discovery issues Billed invoice 20210759	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
09/03/2021	2	Reviewing discovery and drafting pretrial order (6.7); exchanging emails with co-counsel re demonstrative exhibits (.4) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.10h	\$585.00	-	\$4,153.50
09/03/2021	4	Telephone conference with J. Rue re objections to USMJ ruling Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
09/07/2021	•	Reviewing 30b6 depositions for revision of draft Final PTO and revising draft Final PTO (8.0); telephone call with T. O'Leary re same (.2); drafting email to T. O'Leary re same (.1) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,855.50
09/08/2021	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re draft PTO and drafting email to T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
09/09/2021	4	Exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re PTO Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
09/12/2021	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re preparation of PTO and potential motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
09/13/2021	4	Telephone call with J. Rue, D. Soutar, T. O'Leary, S. Sikora re pretrial prep, motions, trial prep, proofs at trial, PTO, exhibits, stipulations, relief requested, motion for summary judgment, motions in limine Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
09/13/2021	4	Revision of PTO and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
09/14/2021	4	Telephone conference with J. Gran re remedy Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
09/14/2021	4	Drafting and revising 56.1 statement and drafting memorandum of law in support of motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.70h	\$585.00	-	\$3,334.50
09/15/2021	a	Drafting Rule 56.1 statement for motion for summary judgment and drafting memorandum of law re	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.30h	\$585.00	-	\$6,025.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
09/21/2021	4	Conducting legal research and revising memo of law in support of motion for summary judgment, reviewing discovery materials and drafting/revising Rule 56.1	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,270.50
09/20/2021	•	Reviewing and annotating discovery materials and preparing/ revising plaintiffs Rule 56.1 statement and conducting legal research and drafting/revising memorandum of law in support of summary judgment (6.6); telephone conference with cocounsel re trial preparation and motions (1.0) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.60h	\$585.00	-	\$4,446.00
09/19/2021	4	Revising Rule 56.1 statement for summary judgment motion Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
09/17/2021	4	Reviewing plaintiff depositions for preparation of PTO and motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
		same (9.2); telephone call with J. Rue and S. Sikora re exhibits, trial preparation, exhibits for motion for summary judgment, PTO, demonstrative exhibits for trial (1.1) Billed invoice 20210759	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 43 of 162 PageID: 16586

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		statement Billed invoice 20210759						
09/22/2021	•	Revising memo of law in support of motion for summary judgment, reviewing discovery materials and drafting/revising Rule 56.1 statement, reviewing local rules related to motions in limine (7.1); telephone conference with cocounsel re memorandum of law in support of motion of summary judgment, motions in limine, trial preparation (1.0) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.10h	\$585.00	-	\$4,738.50
09/23/2021	•	Reviewing discovery materials and identifying exhibits for pre-trial order and revising 56.1 statement (3.8); drafting email to and telephone conference with T. O'Leary re same (.2) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,340.00
09/24/2021	②	Reviewing discovery materials for trial and summary judgment exhibits and drafting/revising Rule 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.20h	\$585.00	-	\$3,042.00
09/25/2021	4	Reviewing and revising rule 56.1 statement and exhibits and revising certifications (4.7); drafting email to S. Sikora re deadlines for final PTO (.1); drafting email to co-counsel re revisions to Rule 56.1	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.10h	\$585.00	-	\$2,983.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 44 of 162 PageID: 16587

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		statement (.2) Billed invoice 20210759						
09/26/2021	②	Reviewing discovery materials for preparation of trial exhibits and PTO, preparation of class certification motion, preparation of summary judgment exhibits and drafting/revising Rule 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.10h	\$585.00	-	\$3,568.50
09/27/2021	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re trial preparation, motion for summary judgment, PTO, and litigation tasks (1.0); telephone call with J. Gran and J. Rue re class certification motion (.5); revising Rule 56.1 statement based on input from co-counsel (1.3); drafting facts section re individual plaintiffs for class certification motion (1.3); reviewing email with T. O'Leary re Rogers emails and responding (.1) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
09/28/2021	•	Revising rule 56.1 statement and memo of law in support of motion for summary judgment and revising certifications in support of motion and drafting email to T. O'Leary re same (4.3) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
09/28/2021	a	Drafting email to J. Gran re class	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 45 of 162 PageID:

Activities Export

03/05/2024 11:21 am

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		cert motion Billed invoice 20210759	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
10/04/2021	②	Reviewing certifications and depositions of systemic witnesses (1.0); participating in co-counsel conference call re same(1.0) Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
10/06/2021	4	Conducting legal research and revising class certification brief (4.6); drafting email to co-counsel re timing of class certification and sj briefs (.1) Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,749.50
10/07/2021	②	Revising 56.1 statement and memo of law Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
10/08/2021	4	Telephone call with amici re potential witnesses in trial Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
10/11/2021	②	Conducting legal research regarding summary judgment memo of law and revising memo of law, reviewing record and revising 56.1 statement, and drafting email to co-counsel re same	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.40h	\$585.00	-	\$2,574.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

16588

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 46 of 162 PageID: 16589

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20210838						
10/12/2021	4	Preparing for and attending discovery conference with USMJ Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,287.00
10/13/2021	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re trial preparation, PTO, summary judgment motion Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
10/26/2021	4	Conducting legal research and revising motion for class certification Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,685.50
10/27/2021	②	Conducting legal research and revising motion for class certification, drafting email to and telephone conference with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.60h	\$585.00	-	\$2,691.00
10/28/2021	4	Conducting legal research and revising motion for class certification (1.2); telephone call with T. O'Leary re same (.2) Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
11/02/2021	a	Revising memo of law in support of motion for class certification and drafting email to J. Rue re same	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 47 of 162 PageID: 16590

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20210905	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
11/03/2021	•	Revising motion for class certification and conducting legal research re same (2.7); emails to and telephone call with co-counsel re motion for class certification (.5) Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,872.00
11/06/2021	4	Conducting legal research and revising class certification motion and drafting email to J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
11/08/2021	②	Meeting with co-counsel re outstanding motions and trial preparation Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
11/11/2021	②	Revising and finalizing PTO and conferring with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
11/12/2021	•	Revising and finalizing PTO and conferring with co-counsel re same, drafting email to C. Labin re same Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,930.50
11/15/2021	②	Conference call with co-counsel (1.3); revising briefs in support of	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	6.60h	\$585.00	-	\$3,861.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 48 of 162 PageID: 16591

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		motion for class certification, conducting legal research and telephone call with J. Rue re same (5.3) Billed invoice 20210905	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
11/16/2021	•	Conducting legal research for and revising memos of law in support of motions for class certification and drafting Certification and organizing exhibits for motions (8.7); telephone conferences and exchanging emails with co-counsel re motions for class certification (.6) Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.30h	\$585.00	-	\$5,440.50
11/17/2021	•	Revising and finalizing Certification and exhibits for memorandum of law in support of motion for 23b3 class certification (8.5); reviewing emails from co-counsel re memo of law in support of 23b2 class certification (.3) Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.80h	\$585.00	-	\$5,148.00
11/17/2021	4	Reviewing revisions to summary judgment memo of law and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
11/18/2021	a	Conducting legal research, organizing exhibits, revising memos of law and certifications, telephone conferences with co-	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.40h	\$585.00	-	\$6,084.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 49 of 162 PageID: 16592

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		counsel re motions for 23(b)(2) and 23(b)(3) class certification and motion for partial summary judgment Billed invoice 20210905	MJS (D.N.J.)					
11/18/2021	4	Conference with co-counsel re relief in SJ motion Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
11/19/2021	•	Conducting legal research, organizing exhibits, revising memos of law and certifications, telephone conferences with cocounsel re motions for 23(b)(2) and 23(b)(3) class certification and motion for partial summary judgment Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	12.10h	\$585.00	-	\$7,078.50
11/20/2021	②	Reviewing and revising motions for 23(b)(2) and 23(b)(3) class certification and motion for summary judgment and telephone conferences with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.80h	\$585.00	-	\$4,563.00
11/21/2021	4	Telephone conference with J. Rue re class certification and summary judgment motions; revising memoranda of law and conducting legal research re same; reviewing exhibits to certifications for	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.10h	\$585.00	-	\$4,738.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 50 of 162 PageID: 16593

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		accuracy Billed invoice 20210905						
11/22/2021	•	Revising and finalizing motions, certifications, exhibits, and memoranda of law for motions for class certification and summary judgment Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
11/23/2021	4	Reviewing exhibits and drafting email to H. Ruiz and telephone conference with H. Ruiz re confidentiality designations Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,930.50
11/23/2021	•	Telephone conference with cocounsel re review of defendants summary judgment motion (.4); drafting email re third party documents in 56.1 statement (.1) Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
11/24/2021	4	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re adjournment request for class cert motion Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
11/29/2021	②	Telephone call with J. Rue, D. Dwyer, T. O'Leary re trial prep and pre-trial motions Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
11/29/2021	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 51 of 162 PageID: 16594

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		response to motion for summary judgment and Rule 56.1 statement (.1); reviewing and annotating defendants' Rule 56.1 statement for preparation of response (1.8); reviewing letter re extension and text order granting same (.1) Billed invoice 20210905	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
12/02/2021	a	Reviewing summary judgment record and drafting response to defendants' Rule 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.50h	\$585.00	-	\$3,217.50
12/05/2021	4	Reviewing defendants' SOMF, reviewing record evidence, and drafting response to defendants' SOMF Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.90h	\$585.00	-	\$2,866.50
12/07/2021	②	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re response to Rule 56.1 statement and brief in opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
12/08/2021	•	Telephone call with J. Rue re preparation/subject of Amici testimony (.3); telephone call with J. Rue and J. Valverde re same (.3); exchanging emails with J. Rue and J. Valverde re same (.2); Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 52 of 162 PageID: 16595

Activities Export

								11.21 0111
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/08/2021	②	Telephone calls with T. O'Leary re response to defendants' motion for summary judgment (.3); exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re same (.2); drafting memo of law in opposition to defendants' motion and conducting legal research re same (3.2) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
12/09/2021	②	Reviewing defendants' Rule 56.1 statement and cited exhibits and preparing response to Rule 56.1 statement (2.0); drafting and revising memorandum of law in opposition to defendants' motion for summary judgment (6.2) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.20h	\$585.00	-	\$4,797.00
12/10/2021	0	Reviewing defendants' Rule 56.1 statement, exhibits cited in statement related to procedural history, current claims, dispute resolution processes, and D.O., reading deposition transcripts, drafting response to Rule 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,685.50
12/11/2021	②	Reviewing defendants' Rule 56.1 statement related to D.O., S.B.C., M.S. and exhibits cited in statement, reading deposition transcripts, drafting response to Rule 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 53 of 162 PageID:

Activities Export

16596

Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/11/2021	•	Reviewing defendants' comments on PTO and drafting response to defendants' witness list (.9); exchanging emails with co-counsel re defendants' comments on PTO and responses (.3) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	_	\$702.00
12/12/2021	4	Reviewing exhibits cited in, reviewing depositions, reviewing record and responding to defendants' 56.1 statement re H.S., C.H.S., and K.M. Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,270.50
12/12/2021	•	Reviewing correspondence from C. Labin to court re PTO and drafting email to co-counsel re same, reviewing defendants' suggested changes to PTO (.4); drafting amended caption and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.1); Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
12/13/2021	•	Reviewing defendants' 56.1 statement re L.G., reviewing exhibits, deposition transcript and drafting response (5.0); reviewing defendants' proposals for final PTO (.4) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
12/14/2021	4	Attending telephone conference with USMJ Skahill (.9); conference with co-counsel re discovery issues and finalizing PTO (.5);	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.90h	\$585.00	-	\$3,451.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 54 of 162 PageID: 16597

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		reviewing Defendants' revisions to the PTO and drafting Plaintiffs' position statement on motions in limine (3.7); reviewing defendants' revisions to stipulations and drafting response (.8) Billed invoice 20220025	MJS (D.N.J.)					
12/14/2021	•	Reviewing and revising memo of law in opposition to motion for summary judgment (1.2); telephone conference with T. O'Leary re response to 56.1 statement (.1) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	_	\$760.50
12/15/2021	4	Participating in meet and confer re PTO (.9); drafting email to C. Labin re designation of deposition transcripts as exhibits when defendants object to live testimony of deponents (.5); telephone conferences with co-counsel re responses/objections to defendants' exhibits, reviewing defendants' objections to our exhibits, drafting responses/objections to defendants' exhibits (7.5); reviewing email from C. Labin re meet and confer and drafting letter to Judge Skahill re PTC (.5) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.40h	\$585.00	-	\$5,499.00
12/16/2021	a	Drafting and revising Contested Facts and Miscellaneous sections	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	8.60h	\$585.00	-	\$5,031.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 55 of 162 PageID:

Activities Export

16598

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		of PTO, reviewing Defendants' changes to PTO, conferring with co-counsel re PTO, exchanging emails with opposing counsel re PTO Billed invoice 20220025	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
12/17/2021	4	Exchanging emails with opposing counsel seeking Defendants' input for sections of PTO, reviewing Dand P- exhibit lists and drafting Jexhibit list, drafting stipulation to amend caption and exchanging emails with opposing counsel re same, conferring with co-counsel re finalizing PTO, exchanging emails with co-counsel re finalizing PTO Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.20h	\$585.00	-	\$5,967.00
12/19/2021	4	Reviewing and revising reply brief re appeal from USMJ decision and responding to emails from cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
12/20/2021	②	Telephone conferences with multiple co-counsel re pre-trial conference, logistics conference, trial prep, witness prep, motions in limine Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
12/20/2021	a	Reviewing and revising reply in support of USMJ appeal and exchanging emails with co-counsel	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

16599

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		re same (.3) Billed invoice 20220025	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
12/20/2021	②	Conducting legal research for, reviewing, and revising brief in opposition to motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,925.00
12/21/2021	•	Attendance at telephonic pre-trial conference (1.2); attendance at telephonic status conference (.1); review of correspondence from C. Labin to court re adjournment requests (.1); conducting legal research re motions in limine and drafting and revising memorandum of law (3.7); exchanging emails with C. Labin re joint exhibits and revisions to stipulations in PTO (.1) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.20h	\$585.00	-	\$3,042.00
12/22/2021	•	Reviewing and revising motion in limine attorney as witness section (2.0); reviewing and revising motion in limine preliminary statement, statement of facts, and section III (1.2); telephone prep call with J. Rue and amici witnesses (1.0); reviewing and revising sections I and II of motions in limine and drafting email to cocounsel re same (2.3) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.50h	\$585.00	-	\$3,802.50
12/23/2021	a	Reviewing input from co-counsel	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	4.60h	\$585.00	-	\$2,691.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 57 of 162 PageID: 16600

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		on memorandum of law in support of motions in limine, conduction legal research re memorandum of law, drafting and finalizing certification of T. O'Leary, reviewing certification of J. Rue, finalizing all documents for filing (4.5); telephone conference with co-counsel re responses to motions in limine and for summary judgment (.1) Billed invoice 20220025	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
12/30/2021	•	Telephone conference with cocounsel and reviewing and revising correspondence to Court repotential for virtual trial (.2); reviewing updated COVID order from J. Wolfson (.1) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
01/03/2022	•	Telephone conference with cocounsel (.5); reviewing response to 56.1 statement and drafting revisions to memo of law in opposition to motion for summary judgment (5.4); drafting emails to T. O'Leary re changes to 56.1 statement response (.3); reviewing summary judgment record for revision of memo of law (1.3) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.50h	\$585.00	-	\$4,387.50
01/04/2022	4	Reviewing response to Defendants' Rule 56.1 Statement and revising memo of law in	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 58 of 162 PageID: 16601

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		opposition to Defendants' Motion for Summary Judgment (4.2); telephone conference with T. O'Leary re same (.1) Billed invoice 20220083	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
01/05/2022	②	Reviewing response to motion in limine, conducting legal research for, and drafting reply in support of motion Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,638.00
01/05/2022	•	Telephone conferences with T. O'Leary re response to Defendants' Rule 56.1 statement (.2); reviewing emails from and responding to emails from co- counsel re response to Defendants' Rule 56.1 statement (.2); conducting legal research for and revising memo of law in opposition to Defendants' motion for summary judgment (1.7) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,228.50
01/06/2022	•	Reviewing discovery record for reply in support of motion in limine, telephone conference with and reviewing email from T. O'Leary re same, and drafting/revising reply brief (1.6); reviewing deposition testimony cited by defendants in opposition to motion in limine, conducting legal research re attorney testimony and drafting/revising reply brief (2.1)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 59 of 162 PageID: 16602

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220083						
01/06/2022	•	Preparation for and participation in amici witness prep phone calls Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
01/07/2022	4	Conference with J. Rue and E. Canty-Barnes re witness prep (.3); exchanging emails with D. Soutar re witness prep (.1) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
01/07/2022	•	Reviewing NJDOE opposition to motions in limine, reviewing discovery records for preparation of reply, drafting and revising reply and conducting legal research re same Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.80h	\$585.00	-	\$3,978.00
01/10/2022	•	Reviewing and revising reply in support of motion in limine, conducting legal research re same, and drafting email to J. Rue re same (4.3); telephone call with cocounsel re outstanding motions, trial preparation, witness preparation, virtual trial possibility (1.0) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
01/11/2022	2	Finalizing reply in support of motions in limine and accompanying exhibits for filing	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 60 of 162 PageID: 16603

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		and drafting emails to J. Rue andT. O'Leary re sameBilled invoice 20220083	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
01/11/2022	②	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re OAL legislation Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
01/12/2022	0	Reviewing and revising response to 56.1 statement and memo of law in opposition to Defendants' motion for summary judgment and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.80h	\$585.00	-	\$3,393.00
01/13/2022	②	Telephone conference with co- counsel re next steps in litigation Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
01/13/2022	②	Attendance at conference with court Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
01/13/2022	②	Conducting legal research re consent in context of hearing dates and revising memo of law (2.3); drafting emails to co-counsel re memo of law (.2) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 61 of 162 PageID: 16604

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
01/16/2022	2	Reviewing discovery record for reviewing and revising response to DSOMF in support of motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
01/17/2022	4	Reviewing discovery for reviewing and revising response to DSOMF in support of motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
01/17/2022	•	Reviewing email from C. Labin re joint exhibit list, reviewing joint exhibit list, and drafting email to C. Labin re same Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
01/18/2022	•	Reviewing and revising exhibits and stipulations for joint final pretrial order, exchanging emails with C. Labin re same, reviewing and confirming changes to exhibit lists due to re-numbering joint exhibits (7.2); reviewing and revising stipulations and confirming changes based on new exhibit numbers, reviewing and taking notes on missing exhibits (3.2) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.40h	\$585.00	-	\$6,084.00
01/19/2022	4	Finalizing changes to exhibit lists for joint final pre-trial order and exchanging emails with C. Labin re same (2.5); exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re response to	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.40h	\$585.00	-	\$4,329.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 62 of 162 PageID: 16605

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		defendants' motion for summary judgment and revisions to response to 56.1 statement (.1); exchanging emails with co-counsel and C. Labin re motion to seal (.2) Billed invoice 20220083						
01/19/2022	•	reviewing opposition to class certification, conducting legal research re 23(b)(2) class certification, and drafting reply (4.4); exchanging emails with J. Rue re next steps for class certification reply (.2) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.60h	\$585.00	-	\$2,691.00
01/20/2022	•	Reviewing defendants' opposition to motions for class certification, telephone conferences with cocunsel and conducting legal research re same (2.4); drafting and revision of reply in support of Rule 23(b)(2) motion (4.0) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,744.00
01/20/2022	②	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re NJDOE SJ motion Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
01/21/2022	②	Reviewing emails from co-counsel re response to 56.1 statement, reviewing discovery, and revising response to 56.1 statement Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 63 of 162 PageID: 16606

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
		23(b)(3) certification (2.1) Billed invoice 20220083	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
01/24/2022	②	Finalizing reply in support of Rule 23(b)(2) certification (2.3); finalizing reply in support of Rule	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.40h	\$585.00	-	\$2,574.00
01/24/2022	②	Reviewing/revising response to 56.1 statement and telephone conference with co-counsel re same (2.0); reviewing/revising brief in opposition to motion for summary judgment and telephone conference with co-counsel re same (.9) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,696.50
01/23/2022	②	Conducting legal research for, drafting, and revising reply in support of motion for 23(b)(3) class certification and conferring with J. Rue re same (4.8); reviewing cocounsel revision to 23(b)(2) reply (.7) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.50h	\$585.00	-	\$3,217.50
01/22/2022	②	Conducting legal research for and reviewing and revising reply in support of motion for Rule 23(b)(2) class certification Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,925.00
01/21/2022	②	Conducting legal research and drafting/revision of reply in support of motion for 23(b)(2) class certification Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.80h	\$585.00	-	\$3,393.00
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
01/24/2022	②	meeting with co-counsel re trial preparation (1.0); exchanging emails with D. Soutar and E.P. re witness preparation (.1) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
01/25/2022	•	Revising stipulations and final joint PTO and drafting emails to cocounsel and C. Labin re same (2.9); telephone call with J. Rue and drafting email to J. Rue re trial preparation (.5) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,989.00
01/26/2022	②	Reviewing opposition to plaintiffs' motion for summary judgment and response to 56.1 statement, conducting legal research for reply, drafting and revising reply, exchanging emails with co-counsel re reply (9.7); telephone calls with co-counsel re structure of reply (.5) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.20h	\$585.00	-	\$5,967.00
01/28/2022	②	Conference with co-counsel re trial preparation Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
01/31/2022	•	Telephone conference with co- counsel re trial preparation (1.8); preparing chronologies and timelines for trial and drafting emails to co-counsel re same (4.8); drafting email to C. Labin re	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.70h	\$585.00	-	\$3,919.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 65 of 162 PageID: 16608

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		marked exhibits and reviewing response (.1) Billed invoice 20220083						
01/31/2022	②	Reviewing and revising reply in support of motion for summary judgment Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
02/01/2022	•	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re changes to pre-hearing orders and telephone conference re same and implications for trial preparation (1.2); exchanging emails with co-counsel re timelines and telephone conferences re timelines (1.5); exchanging emails with co-counsel re preparation for logistics conference (.1); exchanging emails with co-counsel re call to discuss settlement and covid protocols (.1); reviewing PTO and exhibits for trial preparation and telephone conference with co-counsel re trial preparation (2.4); reviewing email from M. Hogan re final PTO and drafting response (.1) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
02/01/2022	4	Finalizing reply brief re summary judgment for filing Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 66 of 162 PageID:

Activities Export

16609

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/01/2022	②	Exchanging emails with co-counsel with proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
02/02/2022	•	Telephone calls with co-counsel re preparation of timelines and trial preparation (2.0); reviewing email from co-counsel re evidentiary issues for trial, conducting legal research, and drafting response (1.7); drafting email to counsel re EP timeline (.1); reviewing, responding to email from C. Labin re D- exhibits and downloading exhibits (.1) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
02/02/2022	•	Reviewing documents and drafting proposed findings of fact Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
02/02/2022	•	Conference with G. Little and T. O'Leary re trial witnesses and reviewing memo from T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
02/03/2022	4	Telephone conferences with co- counsel re paralegal support for trial and drafing emails re same (.2); reviewing email from C. Labin re motion to seal and drafting	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		response (.1); drafting emails to M. Hogan and C. Labin re mislabeled J- exhibit (.1); drafting email to cocounsel re subpoena for E.P. and reviewing correspondence re subpoena (.1); telephone conferences with co-counsel re trial preparation and witness lists and reviewing emails re same (.5); Billed invoice 20220138						
02/03/2022	②	Reviewing exhibits and stipulations and drafting proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,270.50
02/04/2022	4	Reviewing trial exhibits and stipulations and preparing proposed findings and conclusions and drafting emails to co-counsel re same and issues related to exhibit list (9.7); preparation for and participation in telephone call with counsel for NJDOE and co-counsel re covid protocols and settlement discussions and follow-up communications with co-counsel (1.1) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.80h	\$585.00	-	\$6,318.00
02/05/2022	•	Reviewing emails from co-counsel re timelines and reviewing timelines for trial prep and potential demonstrative exhibits (1.0); reviewing exhibits and stipulation and preparing proposed findings of	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.90h	\$585.00	-	\$5,206.50

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 68 of 162 PageID: 16611

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		fact and conclusions of law (7.9) Billed invoice 20220138						
02/06/2022	②	Reviewing PTO and exhibits and drafting proposed findings of fact and drafting emails to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.20h	\$585.00	-	\$5,382.00
02/07/2022	•	Reviewing and responding to email from C. Labin re exhibit books and drafting email to M. Hogan re same and reviewing response, drafting email to C. Labin re same and reviewing response (.2); reviewing email from M. Hogan re motion to seal conference call (.1); drafting email to co-counsel re proposed final order/settlement terms (.1) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
02/07/2022	4	Reviewing emails from G. Little and T. O'Leary re draft findings of fact and drafting response Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
02/08/2022	•	Telephone call with J. Rue re trial preparation and paralegal support (.1); reviewing email from M. Hogan and H. Ruiz re motion to seal and drafting response re exhibits under seal (.3); telephone call with H. Ruiz, C. Labin, M. Hogan re motion to seal and exhibits for trial (.5);	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220138						
02/08/2022	②	Conducting legal research and revising proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
02/09/2022	•	Exchanging emails with H. Ruiz and M. Hogan re motion to seal and exhibits for trial (.2); reviewing email from C. Labin re exhibits (.1); conference with co-counsel re trial preparation(.7); drafting and revising witness notes to be used in preparation of outlines for K. Ehling, D. Rota, L. Sanders, and E. Bass (5.5); trial preparation, analyzing best and worst witnesses and documents (2.0) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	8.50h	\$585.00	-	\$4,972.50
02/09/2022	•	Conducting legal research and revising proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,989.00
02/10/2022	•	Telephone conferences and emails with co-counsel re trial preparation (.8); drafting email to C. Labin re correction to exhibit list (.1); reviewing deposition of C. Marano and drafting notes (2.1); drafting bullet points for E.P. testimony outline (.5); reviewing notes on	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.50h	\$585.00	-	\$2,632.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 70 of 162 PageID: 16613

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		witnesses for trial prep (1.0) Billed invoice 20220138						
02/10/2022	4	Reviewing exhibits and depositions and revising proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law (6.2); exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re missing exhibit (.2) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,744.00
02/12/2022	②	Trial preparation, reviewing exhibits and reviewing memos from co-counsel re best and worst documents/points for each witness Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
02/13/2022	②	Telephone conference with co- counsel re preparation for 2.14.2021 hearing (.8); reviewing exhibits and stipulations and preparing comparative timelines for E.P., M.S., and A.S. (3.3); ; conferring with J. Rue re trial preparation (1.0) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.10h	\$585.00	_	\$2,983.50
02/13/2022	②	Reviewing and revising proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law and drafting email to cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
02/14/2022	②	Meeting with co-counsel for trial strategy and preparation Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,989.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/15/2022	②	Conference with co-counsel re upcoming conference with defendants (.7); conference with co-counsel re follow-up to phone call with NJDOE counsel (.3); telephone calls with co-counsel re trial preparation and continued preparation of timelines for trial (3.7) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,749.50
02/17/2022	•	Telephone conference with cocounsel re trial issues and follow-up on call with C. Labin (.4) telephone conferences with cocounsel re dismissal of plaintiffs (.8) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
02/17/2022	②	Revising draft preliminary injunction order Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
02/18/2022	4	Reviewing and revising proposed findings of fact and conclusions of law and trial preparation Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
02/18/2022	4	Call with co-counsel re trial preparation and preparation for logistics conference	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220138	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/20/2022	②	Conducting legal research and reviewing and revising forms of order for permanent injunction and declaratory judgment Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
02/21/2022	②	Participating in call with co-counsel re trial preparation and preparation for logistics conference (1.0); reviewing and responding to email from E.P. re update on trial (.1); reviewing email from T. O'Leary re language in pre-hearing order in A.S. case and drafting response (.8); Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,111.50
02/21/2022	②	Reviewing emails from co-counsel re opposition to motion for pro hac admission and drafting response (.1); reviewing opposition to pro hac motion, conducting legal research, and summarizing research in email to co-counsel (2.5) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.60h	\$585.00	-	\$1,521.00
02/22/2022	②	Participating in conference calls re trial prep and pre-hearing conference (2.5); participate in conference with court (1.0); conference with co-counsel after conference with court (.4)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.90h	\$585.00	-	\$2,281.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 73 of 162 PageID:

Activities Export

16616

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220138						
02/22/2022	②	Conducting legal research re form of permanent injunction orders Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
02/23/2022	4	Conducting legal research re notice in (b)(3) issues class, drafting emails to and telephone conferences with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,159.00
02/24/2022	4	Telephone call with co-counsel re class certification and discovery issues (.8); conducting legal research re class certification and bifurcation, notice issues (4.2) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,925.00
02/28/2022	4	Telephone call with co-counsel re status, trial prep and prep for March 8 conference Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
03/07/2022	4	Conference with co-counsel regarding conference with USMJ Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
03/08/2022	②	Participation in hearing regarding outstanding discovery appeal (2.5);	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	4.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,340.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 74 of 162 PageID: 16617

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		conferring with co-counsel regarding correspondence to court related to supplemental discovery (2 meetings) (1.0); reviewing and revising correspondence to court and drafting emails to co-counsel re same (.5) Billed invoice 20220223	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
03/16/2022	②	Reviewing opinion and order re discovery appeal and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.3); telephone calls with T. O'Leary and J. Rue re supplemental discovery, drafting email to co-counsel re same, and reviewing responses (.6) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
03/17/2022	②	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re 30b6 and supplemental deposition notices (.1); telephone call with co-counsel re supplemental depositions (.5) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
03/21/2022	o	Reviewing 30(b)(6) notice and telephone call with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
03/22/2022	4	Reviewing 30b6 notice Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 75 of 162 PageID: 16618

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
03/22/2022	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re order of proof Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
03/29/2022	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re confidentiality designations (.1); drafting email to E.P. re status update (.1) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
03/31/2022	4	Reviewing letter re discovery issues Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
03/31/2022	•	Reviewing decision in related class action (.4) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
04/01/2022	4	Attending zoom deposition of D. Rota and conferring with co- counsel post deposition Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.50h	\$585.00	-	\$3,802.50
04/04/2022	4	Reviewing comments of T. O'Leary on Proposed Findings of Fact and Conclusions of Law and making revisions based on comments	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 76 of 162 PageID: 16619

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220302						
04/05/2022	4	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery issues (.1); conference with co-counsel re discovery/trial issues and prep for 30(b)(6) deposition (1.0) Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
04/06/2022	•	Reviewing NJDOE memo of law in support of motion for summary judgment and exhibits for revision of proposed findings of fact and for drafting email to co-counsel re preparation for NJDOE 30b6 deposition Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
04/06/2022	②	Reviewing emails from co-counsel re preparation for deposition and questions regarding justification for injunctive relief, reviewing record re same and drafting responses Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
04/06/2022	4	Reviewing prior NJDOE corrective action plan and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
04/06/2022	②	Draft email to co-counsel re deliberative process privilege Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

16620

D4/07/2022 O Telephone calls with G. Little and T. O'Leary re preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition (4); telephone call with J. Rue re deliberative process and discovery issues (4); drafting email to G. Little re deliberative process (9) Billed invoice 20220302 O Listening to deposition of K. Ehling and participating in follow-up phone calls with J. Rue re deposition prep (-1) Billed invoice 20220302 O Listening to deposition of K. Ehling and participating in follow-up phone calls with T. O'Leary re deposition prep (-1) Billed invoice 20220302 O Exchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for additional deposition (-1); reviewing hearing files and exchanging emails with coursel of record for cases adjudicated in the past 2 years and drafting certifications re same (1.2) Billed invoice 20220302 O Drafting email to T. O'Leary re follow-up depositions (-1); reviewing case files for cases resolved in prior 2 school years for preparation for 10 (C. P., et al. v. N.J.) Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) O Drafting email to T. O'Leary re follow-up depositions (-1); reviewing case files for cases resolved in prior 2 school years for preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 O Reviewing deposition outtine for O O O O O O O O O									
T. OʻLeary re preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition (4); kelephone call with J. Rue re deliberative process and discovery issues (4); draffing email to G. Little re deliberative process (4); draffing email to G. Little re deliberative process (4); draffing email to G. Calterine discovery issues (4); draffing email to G. Calterine deliberative process (9)	Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
and participating in follow-up phone calls with occursel (3.5); exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re deposition prep (.1) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/09/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for additional deposition (.1); reviewing hearing files and exchanging emails with counsel of record for cases adjudicated in the past 2 years and drafting certifications re same (1.2) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/10/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for additional deposition (.1); reviewing hearing files and exchanging emails with counsel of record for cases adjudicated in the past 2 years and drafting certifications re same (1.2) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/10/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/12/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/12/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 O4/12/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue re certifications in preparation for feducation, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) O1664.2020-Perry Catherine 1.30h S585.00 Catherine 1.40h \$585.00 Available in the past 2 years and with in preparation for feducation, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) O2664.2020-Perry Catherine 1.40h \$585.00 Available in voice 20220302 O4/12/2022 OExchanging emails with J. Rue recertification in the feducation, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) O4/12/2022 OXIVE Available in voice 20220302	04/07/2022	②	T. O'Leary re preparation for 30(b)(6) deposition (.4); telephone call with J. Rue re deliberative process and discovery issues (.4); drafting email to G. Little re deliberative process (.9)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
certifications in preparation for additional deposition (.1); reviewing hearing files and exchanging emails with counsel of record for cases adjudicated in the past 2 years and drafting certifications re same (1.2) Billed invoice 20220302 Drafting email to T. O'Leary re follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition for Generation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) C.P., et al. v. N.J. Catherine 1.40h \$585.00 - \$81 Merino Reisman Catherine 1.40h \$585.00 - \$81 Merino Reisman Od/10/2022 Catherine 1.40h \$585.00 - \$81 C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Reisman Od/10/2022 Reviewing deposition outline for O1664.2020-Perry Catherine 0.80h \$585.00 - \$46	04/08/2022	②	and participating in follow-up phone calls with co-counsel (3.5); exchanging emails with T. O'Leary re deposition prep (.1)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	3.60h	\$585.00	-	\$2,106.00
follow-up depositions (.1); reviewing case files for cases resolved in prior 2 school years for preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302 Reviewing deposition outline for 01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Merino Reisman No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.) C.P., et al. v. N.J. Merino Reisman No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.) A catherine 0.80h \$585.00 - \$46	04/09/2022	②	certifications in preparation for additional deposition (.1); reviewing hearing files and exchanging emails with counsel of record for cases adjudicated in the past 2 years and drafting certifications re same (1.2)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
1,354.00h \$0.00 \$792,4	04/10/2022	•	follow-up depositions (.1); reviewing case files for cases resolved in prior 2 school years for preparation for follow-up deposition of C. Hendricks and drafting notes for deposition questions (1.3)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
	04/12/2022	4	Reviewing deposition outline for	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,						1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 78 of 162 PageID: 16621

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		ALJ Moscowitz and emails from co-counsel re same (.6); reviewing and responding to emails re deposition of C. Hendricks (.1); telephone call with T. O'Leary re same (.1) Billed invoice 20220302	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
04/13/2022	4	Attending via telephone deposition of ALJ Moscowitz (2.0); conference call with co-counsel re deposition (.8) Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,638.00
04/14/2022	②	Reviewing emails re order regarding referral to mediation and telephone call with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
04/15/2022	②	Call with co-counsel re responding to Court order re mediation and communications with opposing counsel re same Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
04/20/2022	②	Conference call with co-counsel re potential mediation options and G. Little call with D. Dryzga Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
04/21/2022	4	Reviewing email from J. Rue and telephone conference with J. Rue re memo re preparation for mediation	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 79 of 162 PageID: 16622

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220302	MJS (D.N.J.)					
04/22/2022	②	Reviewing and revising draft consent orders Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
04/25/2022	4	Conducting legal research re consent order and fee awards for enforcement and drafting email to J. Rue re same and reviewing response (2.0); telephone conference with J. Rue re memo to file re settlement negotiations (1.3) Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,930.50
04/26/2022	②	Reviewing memorandum re settlement parameters and conference with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,111.50
04/27/2022	•	Conference with co-counsel re status of litigation, discovery, mediation strategy, trial strategy (.8); reviewing memorandum re settlement parameters and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.5); telephone calls with J. Rue re settlement parameters and memo to team re same (.8); telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement (.2) Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,228.50
		- Dilled HTV0100 Z0ZZ030Z			4 254 225		*^ ^^	\$700 40E 00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 80 of 162 PageID: 16623 **Activities Export**

Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
04/29/2022	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re proposed guidelines and drafting response and reviewing reply Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
04/29/2022	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re settlement issues and negotiation strategy Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
05/02/2022	•	Reviewing order from court setting settlement conference and drafting email to co-counsel, reviewing responses (.2); telephone call with J. Rue re settlement memorandum and reviewing emails from co-counsel re same (.1); reviewing settlement memorandum for preparation of settlement conference letter for court (1.0); reviewing emails from co-counsel re settlement parameters and drafting response, reviewing reply (.8); Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,228.50
05/03/2022	•	Conferences with co-counsel re settlement demand and memorandum (.7); telephone call with J. Rue re settlement issues/ demand/memorandum and research re standing (.7) Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

16624

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 82 of 162 PageID: 16625

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		conference position statement (3.1) Billed invoice 20220412	MJS (D.N.J.)					
05/10/2022	4	Participation in telephone conference re OAL deposition (.2); conference with co-counsel re depositions (.1); reviewing outline for settlement memorandum and initial drafting of memorandum (1.4) Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
05/11/2022	②	Telephone attendance at deposition of ALJ Bass and follow-up call with co-counsel (2.1); telephone call with J. Rue re class certification issues (.3); telephone call with co-counsel re settlement issues, proposed guidelines, parameters of proposed settlement (.7) Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
05/12/2022	②	Revising prehearing guidelines in preparation for settlement conference proposal and conducting legal research for proposal (2.5); telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement (.3) Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,638.00
05/13/2022	②	Telephone conference with co- counsel re discovery issues and depositions of 30b6 witnesses and C. Hendricks	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 83 of 162 PageID: 16626

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220412	MJS (D.N.J.)					
05/13/2022	•	Conference with co-counsel re settlement issues Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
05/16/2022	•	Reviewing depositions, summary judgment and class certification filings, and discovery for preparation of settlement conference memorandum and drafting memorandum Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
05/16/2022	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re deposition of ALJ Bass Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
05/17/2022	•	Reviewing order from Court and drafting email to E.P. re settlement conference and trial date (.2); reviewing emails from R. Thurston and attorneys in related cases re meet and confer (.1); reviewing emails from DAG Labin and Fichera re meet and confer (.4); drafting email to J. Rue re settlement demand and reviewing response (.1); responding to email from E.P. re settlement demand (.3) Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
		Dilled Invoice 20220412			4 05 4 00'		40.00	6700 105 0 1
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 84 of 162 PageID: 16627

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
05/18/2022	②	Attendance at meet and confer re discovery consolidation and telephone call with co-counsel Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
05/18/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re preparation for settlement conference Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
05/19/2022	•	Reviewing record, depositions, court filings, and drafting and revising confidential mediation statement and drafting email to G. Little re same Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,340.00
05/20/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re discovery issues Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
05/24/2022	②	Attendance at conference with Judge Skahill re scheduling issues Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.60h	\$585.00	-	\$936.00
05/25/2022	②	Drafting email to co-counsel re amendment of DCO for related cases and reviewing response Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 85 of 162 PageID: 16628

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
06/09/2022	2	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
06/09/2022	②	Preparation for and attendance at settlement conference and post-conference consultation with co-counsel Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,749.50
06/08/2022	•	Conference with J. Rue, G. Little, T. O'Leary re preparation for settlement conference (1.0); reviewing documents in preparation for settlement conference (1.7); conference with litigation team re preparation for settlement conference (1.0) Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
06/07/2022	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement conference Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
06/06/2022	•	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement conference preparation (.3); conducting legal research re injunctive relief in the absence of class certification (3.0) Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,930.50
05/26/2022	4	Review comments on settlement memo Billed invoice 20220412	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

16629

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.0 0 1,354.00
06/17/2022	a	Exchanging emails with co-counsel	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
06/16/2022	()	Conducting legal research and exchanging emails with J. Rue re notice requirements for settlement of (b)(2) class actions Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
06/15/2022	②	Exchanging emails with J. Rue re settlement proposal, proposed class definition, and notice issues (1.0); revising draft settlement proposal and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.9); telephone call with J. Rue re proposed settlement proposal and notice issues (.8); conducting legal research re notice issues for (b)(2) settlement (2.1) Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.80h	\$585.00	-	\$2,808.00
06/14/2022	②	Drafting proposed Settlement Agreement and telephone conferences with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.20h	\$585.00	-	\$3,042.00
06/10/2022	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement issues and drafting email re same (.3); reviewing email from G. Little re same (.1) Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
		fee petition Billed invoice 20220489	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
Date ▲	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 87 of 162 PageID: 16630

Activities Export

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		re potential settlement proposal Billed invoice 20220489	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
06/20/2022	4	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re settlement issues and telephone call with T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	<u>-</u>	\$175.50
06/21/2022	a	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re form of order Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
06/23/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement proposal/draft injunction (.4); reviewing settlement proposal/draft injunction (.3); telephone call with T. O'Leary re samel (.2) Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
06/28/2022	a	Conducting legal research re class certification/review of 3d Circuit decision Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
07/05/2022	4	Legal research on class certification and drafting email to co-counsel re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

07/18/2022	②	Telephone call with K. Haley re strategy/settlement issues (.5);	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	2.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,287.00
07/17/2022	②	Telephone call with G. Little re trial strategy issues Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
07/15/2022	②	Reviewing email from J. Rue re litigation strategy and telephone call with G. Little re same Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
07/13/2022	②	Conference call with co-counsel re 23(b)(3) issues Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
07/12/2022	②	Reviewing emails regarding 23(b)(3) class, reviewing class certification motion and accompanying briefing, and drafting email to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
07/07/2022	①	Reviewing and responding to email from G. Little re response to letter from NJDOE re postponing trial (.1); reviewing and revising correspondence from J. Rue to Court re postponing trial date (.3) Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 89 of 162 PageID: 16632

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		telephone call with G. Little re same (.3); conducting legal research re 23(b)(3) predominance class certification issues (1.4) Billed invoice 20220569	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
07/19/2022	②	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re recent developments Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
07/20/2022	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re settlement strategy Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
07/25/2022	4	Attendance at virtual settlement conference Billed invoice 20220569	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
08/04/2022	②	Reviewing opinion on class certification (.2); drafting email to T. O'Leary re pre-trial order (.1) Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/19/2022	②	Review of decision on class certification and telephone call with T. O'Leary Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 90 of 162 PageID: 16633

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/21/2022	4	Reviewing decision on class certification and telephone conferences with co-counsel re same (.9); reviewing and responding to emails from co-counsel re next steps (.5) Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
08/21/2022	4	Drafting email to E.P. re class certification decision and trial prep Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/22/2022	•	Conference with co-counsel re trial preparation, settlement negotiations, next steps after class certification (.8); telephone conference with E.P. re trial prep and drafting email to G. Little and T. O'Leary re same (.7) Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	<u>-</u>	\$877.50
08/23/2022	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re class certification issues Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/24/2022	②	Team meeting re trial issues and class certification (1.0); conducting legal research and drafting email to core team re notice issues (.5); conducting legal research re 23(b)(3) class certification and notice issues (2.7)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 91 of 162 PageID: 16634

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220648						
08/29/2022	4	Revising proposed findings and conclusions and telephone conferences with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.20h	\$585.00	-	\$3,627.00
08/30/2022	②	Conferring with co-counsel and finalizing and filing proposed findings and conclusions (6.9) Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.90h	\$585.00	-	\$4,036.50
08/30/2022	4	Telephone conferences with J. Rue and G. Little re update on settlement communications Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
08/31/2022	4	Travel to/from Newark and participation in witness prep of E.P. Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.30h	\$585.00	-	\$4,270.50
09/01/2022	•	Reviewing opinion on summary judgment motions and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same re impact on trial preparation and potential mediation, assisting with trial preparation (6.4); telephone calls with T. O'Leary re same (.5); conference with G. Little and T. O'Leary re same (.5) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.40h	\$585.00	-	\$4,329.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 92 of 162 PageID: 16635

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
09/02/2022	②	Assisting with preparation of exhibits for trial Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
09/04/2022	•	Reviewing petition for permission to appeal, conducting legal research, and drafting opposition (9.2); telephone calls with cocounsel re opposition to petition for permission to appeal and trial strategy (1.0) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.20h	\$585.00	-	\$5,967.00
09/05/2022	②	Conducting legal research and drafting opposition to petition for interlocutory appeal under Rule 23(f) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	10.10h	\$585.00	-	\$5,908.50
09/06/2022	4	Preparing for and attending logistics conference with Court and meeting with opposing counsel re exhibits and settlement discussions Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.00h	\$585.00	-	\$4,095.00
09/07/2022	4	Conferring with co-counsel re proposal for revisions to proposed due process hearing guidelines Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
09/07/2022	②	Preparing for and attending hearing on motion in limine and	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	3.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,989.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 93 of 162 PageID: 16636

Activities Export

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
09/13/2022	②	Reviewing motion for stay, conducting legal research re same, and drafting opposition (6.2); telephone call with T. O'Leary re	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,744.00
09/12/2022	4	Finalizing and filing response to petition for leave in court of appeals Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00	-	\$3,100.50
09/11/2022	4	Reviewing and revising opposition to petition for interlocutory appeal and conferring with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
09/09/2022	4	Conducting legal research and revising opposition to petition for interlocutory appeal and conferring with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,989.00
09/08/2022	②	Telephone conference with cocounsel re settlement discussions and opposition to petition for permission to appeal (2.0); reviewing and revising brief in opposition and conducting legal research re same (7.3) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.30h	\$585.00	-	\$5,440.50
		conferring with co-counsel after hearing (3.2); telephone call with T. O'Leary re same (.2) Billed invoice 20220760	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 94 of 162 PageID: 16637

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		same (.2) Billed invoice 20220760	MJS (D.N.J.)					
09/15/2022	②	Revising and finalizing opposition to motion to stay and telephone conferences with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
09/18/2022	②	Reviewing correspondence to Court re bifurcation and telephone conference with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
09/19/2022	•	Reviewing letter re bifurcation/ severance filed by NJDOE and telephone conference with J. Rue re same, conducting legal research re non-mutual issue preclusion and drafting email to co-counsel re same in preparation for 2 pm call, telephone conferences with co- counsel re preparation for 2 pm call (3.1); participating in zoom conference with Court and follow- up conferences with co-counsel (1.8) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.90h	\$585.00	-	\$2,866.50
09/19/2022	0	Conducting legal research re petitions for leave under rule 23(f) briefing requirements Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
09/20/2022	④	Reviewing stipulated exhibits and drafting, reviewing and revising contested exhibit list, exchanging emails with C. Labin and cocounsel re same, telephone conference with co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
09/24/2022	②	Reviewing emergency stay motion and drafting response, telephone conference with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
09/26/2022	②	Conferring with co-counsel re settlement negotiations and reviewing Third Circuit order on petition for leave to appeal Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.50h	\$585.00	-	\$2,632.50
09/27/2022	•	Preparing for and attending mediation, drafting and filing correspondence to court re adjournment, telephone conference with Judge Schneider re adjournment request, telephone conferences with co-counsel re mediation Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	9.50h	\$585.00	-	\$5,557.50
09/28/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement issues (.8); telephone call with G. Little re settlement and trial issues (.2); reviewing and responding to email from T.	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 96 of 162 PageID: 16639

Activities Export

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		O'Leary re mediation (.1); reviewing and responding to messages from J. Rue re settlement issues (.1); telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement issues and trial preparation (.2) Billed invoice 20220760						
09/29/2022	②	Telephone calls and exchanging emails with J. Rue re settlement and fee issues Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
09/30/2022	4	Conference with J. Rue and T. O'Leary re attorney's fees Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
10/03/2022	•	Reviewing email from C. Labin re notice to class, drafting response, and exchanging emails with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
10/07/2022	•	Reviewing emails from mediator re notice and re-scheduling telephone conference and exchanging emails with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
10/10/2022	②	Reviewing and commenting on draft correspondence to court in the event that NJDOE seeks adjournment (.1); reviewing and	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 97 of 162 PageID: 16640

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		responding to email from co- counsel re rebuttal witnesses and current pre-hearing orders (.1); drafting email to co-counsel re pre- hearing orders (.1); reviewing follow-up emails on NJDOE adjournment request correspondence (.1) Billed invoice 20220904	MJS (D.N.J.)					
10/10/2022	4	telephone conference with J. Rue re preparation for upcoming call with Judge Schneider re mediation talks Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
10/11/2022	•	Telephone call with Judge Schneider and J. Rue re mediation (1.0); call with J. Rue re next steps in mediation (.5); telephone calls with G. Little, T. O'Leary, and J. Rue re trial preparation and settlement negotiations (1.5) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
10/12/2022	②	Telephone calls with J. Rue re email to mediator confirming settlement discussions and review and revision of email (.7); telephone calls with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations (1.0); reviewing email from mediator re update on settlement discussions (.2); conducting legal research re special master requirements (1.0)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,696.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 98 of 162 PageID: 16641

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20220904						
10/13/2022	•	Participating in call with amici re case update (.8); exchanging emails with co-counsel re discovery related to June 2022 correspondence from USDOE to NJDOE and drafting FOIA request re same (.8); conducting legal research and drafting email to co-counsel re class action tolling and impact on settlement negotiations (1.5); telephone calls and exchanging emails with J. Rue re settlement negotiations (1.2); reviewing email from Judge Schneider and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.3); reviewing proposed response to Judge Schneider and revising (.7) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	5.30h	\$585.00		\$3,100.50
10/14/2022	•	Telephone call with G. Little and J. Rue re mediation strategy (.4); telephone call with J. Rue re drafting proposed settlement (.1); drafting and revising proposed consent order (2.3) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
10/17/2022	②	Conducting legal research re class action tolling and drafting email to co-counsel re same (1.0); reviewing proposed consent order and participating in conferences with co-counsel re proposed	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 99 of 162 PageID: 16642

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		consent order in preparation for settlement call with opposing counsel (2.1) Billed invoice 20220904						
10/18/2022	•	Conferring with G. Little and J. Rue in preparation for settlement call with defendants (.4); participating in settlement call with defendants (1.6); telephone conference with T. O'Leary re settlement issues (.3) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
10/19/2022	4	Multiple telephone calls with G. Little re settlement negotiations (.6); multiple telephone calls with G. Little & J. Rue re settlement negotiations (.5); drafting proposed correspondence to Court re joint requests for amendment and adjournment and proposed form of order re same and email to J. Rue and G. Little re same (.6) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
10/20/2022	②	Preparation for and attendance at mediation (6.0); telephone call with co-counsel re response to motion to stay (.2); telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement issues (.2) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,744.00
10/21/2022	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re settlement negotiations and trial preparation Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
10/22/2022	4	Conducting research regarding amendment of class definition and drafting memo re same (3.0); telephone call with J. Rue re same (.1) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
10/24/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement negotiations and trial preparation (.2); telephone call with G. Little re settlement negotiations (.1); conference call with team re status of settlement negotiations, next steps, and trial preparation (1.0) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
10/25/2022	4	Reviewing correspondence from opposing counsel to court, drafting email to team re same and reviewing responses Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
10/26/2022	4	Telephone calls with J. Rue and G. Little re settlement negotiations and order entered by Court Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
10/26/2022	4	Telephone call with G. Little re witness preparation for trial Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
10/27/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re modification of class certification and settlement issues Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
10/31/2022	4	Reviewing redlined settlement proposal from NJDOE (1.0); telephone call with J. Rue and G. Little re same (1.0); conducting legal research re settlement of class actions (.4) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
11/01/2022	4	Telephone calls with T. O'Leary, J. Rue, and G. Little re NJDOE response to settlement proposal (.8); conducting legal research on legal fees in settlement of class actions and telephone calls with J. Rue re negotiations (2.0); reviewing Compliance Monitor portion of NJDOE settlement proposal and drafting response for review by G. Little and J. Rue (1.9); reviewing draft joint letter to Judge Hillman re adjournment, telephone conference with J. Rue re same, and drafting email to C. Labin re same (.2)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.90h	\$585.00	-	\$2,866.50
11/02/2022	②	Travel to/from and attendance at status conference in Camden Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
11/03/2022	4	Preparation for and attendance at mediation and conference with cocunsel after mediation Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.00h	\$585.00	-	\$3,510.00
11/04/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re attorneys' fees negotiations Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
11/05/2022	②	Reviewing redline of settlement agreement from NJDOE and drafting counter-proposal Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
11/05/2022	②	Telephone call with co-counsel re draft settlement communications Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
11/06/2022	•	Revising counter-proposal for settlement negotiations (.8); revising letter from J. Rue re counter-proposal for settlement negotiations (.2); reviewing draft correspondence regarding fee negotiations and drafting email re same (.2) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
11/07/2022	a	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement negotiation strategy (.5); telephone call with G. Little re	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		same (.3); telephone call with co- counsel re status of settlement negotiations (.5) Billed invoice 20221042	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
11/07/2022	②	Exchanging emails with J. Rue and K. Rue re fee petition documentation (.1); reviewing billing report through 10.31.2022 (.3); Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
11/08/2022	4	Participation in zoom call with co- counsel re revisions to settlement proposal (2.0); review of revised settlement proposal (1.0) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
11/09/2022	•	Telephone call with J. Rue re revisions to settlement agreement Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
11/10/2022	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re fees submission and settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
11/15/2022	4	Exchanging emails with and telephone conferences with J. Rue re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
		Billed invoice 20221042	Department of Education,	Reisman				
11/18/2022	4	Reviewing and revising proposed template for monitor report	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
		Billed invoice 20221042						
11/17/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re revisions to settlement and adjournment request form (.3); drafting adjournment request form and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.4); reviewing and commenting on J.Rue revisions to consent order (.1); reviewing J. Rue revisions to adjournment request form (.1)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
11/16/2022	•	Telephone call with J. Rue and G. Little re preparation for settlement discussions (.3); conference with J. Rue, G. Little and NJDOE counsel re settlement discussions (.9); telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement discussions (.1) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
11/15/2022	②	Reviewing bills for preparation of fee petition Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
11/15/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue and G. Little re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
11/18/2022	4	Conference with co-counsel re fee petition and calculation of fees (.3); conference with J. Rue re same (.3) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
11/28/2022	②	Attendance at mediation Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.50h	\$585.00	-	\$4,387.50
11/30/2022	②	Telephone calls with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations and NJDOE's inability to comply with agreed-upon timeline (.8); follow-up telephone call with J. Rue re potential settlement options (.3); telephone call with J. Gran re class action settlement and enforcement (.4); drafting email to G. Little and J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
12/01/2022	4	Telephone conference with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations and drafting follow-up email Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
12/04/2022	4	Telephone call with G. Little and J. Rue re response to NJDOE settlement proposal and drafting	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		response to proposal, drafting email to G. Little and J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230030	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
12/05/2022	4	Conference with J. Rue and J. Valverde re settlement negotiations and follow-up conference with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
12/05/2022	4	Reviewing and revising letter to court re notice to class Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
12/06/2022	②	Telephone call with J. Rue re revisions to proposed consent order Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
12/06/2022	9	Reviewing letter from C. Labin re class notice and reviewing and responding to emails from G. Little and T. O'Leary re same Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
12/08/2022	②	Reviewing NJDOE comments on proposed Notice, drafting revisions to Notice, and exchanging emails with co-counsel re revisions to Notice Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/09/2022	②	Reviewing memorandum of law in support of motion to approve class notice, telephone conferences with G. Little and exchanging emails with D. Soutar, J. Rue, J. Wasserman, and S. Edward re same Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	_	\$1,053.00
12/12/2022	•	Reviewing emails from Judge Schneider, G. Little, J. Rue, and R. Thurston re December 14 mediation (.3); telephone call with J. Rue re same (.3); telephone calls with G. Little re same (.4) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	_	\$585.00
12/14/2022	•	Drafting email to G. Little re settlement negotiations and zoom mediation (.1); telephone call with G. Little re settlement negotiations (.2); attendance at zoom mediation session (1.0); telephone call with G. Little re next steps in settlement (.1); drafting email to J. Rue and G. Little re same (.1) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
12/15/2022	•	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement negotiations (.3); reviewing email from J. Rue re settlement negotiations (.1) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
12/15/2022	②	Telephone call with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		(1.0); telephone call with J. Rue re attorney's fees demand in settlement negotiations (.3)Billed invoice 20230030	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
12/17/2022	②	Reviewing and responding to emails re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
12/19/2022	4	Conference with G. Little and J. Valverde re update and trial prep (.8); telephone calls with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations (1.0) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,053.00
12/20/2022	4	Telephone calls with G. Little re settlement issues (.5); conference with J. Rue and G. Little re settlement issues (.5); mediation conference (.7) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
12/20/2022	4	Reviewing NJDOE's motion to stay Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
12/20/2022	4	Reviewing NJDOE's opposition to class notice motion and conducting legal research re same Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/21/2022	•	Reviewing exchange between co- counsel re settlement negotiations (.1); reviewing and responding to email from J. Rue re settlement negotiations and telephone call with J. Rue re same (.3); reviewing revision to settlement agreement from NJDOE and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same (.9) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00		\$760.50
12/22/2022	•	Reviewing redline of settlement agreement and correspondence re amendment of class definition with J. Rue (.8); reviewing changes to adjournment request from with J. Rue (.3); telephone call with G. Little re settlement issues (.2); reviewing email exchange re change to class definition and impact on settlement and drafting emails to J. Rue and G. Little re same (.5); telephone call with G. Little re same (.2); reviewing email from J. Rue re same (.1); reviewing and revising draft letter to NJDOE re settlement redline (.3) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
12/22/2022	②	Reviewing motion to stay and drafting opposition Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,053.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/22/2022	4	Reviewing with J. Rue letter to opposing counsel re consent order on interlocutory appeal Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
12/23/2022	4	Drafting and revising opposition brief to motion to stay and conducting legal research re same Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.80h	\$585.00	-	\$2,223.00
12/23/2022	4	Telephone calls with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
01/09/2023	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re response to settlement and reviewing NJDOE proposal, comparing to our response, and drafting email to J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
01/12/2023	4	Telephone call with mediator and follow-up telephone call for clarification (.6); telephone calls with co-counsel re response to call with mediator and reviewing draft letter in response (.5) Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
01/16/2023	4	Telephone call with John Rue re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
01/19/2023	•	Reviewing settlement response and participation in conference with co-counsel re settlement negotiations (.4); drafting follow-up email to C. Labin re incentive payments (.1) Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
01/20/2023	•	Reviewing draft settlement proposal and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same (.7); revising redline from defendants and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.3); reviewing email from J. Wasserman and revising redline, drafting email to co-counsel re same (.2) Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
01/23/2023	4	Telephone call with J. Rue re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
01/24/2023	4	Telephone call with T. O'Leary re settlement negotiations and trial preparation Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
01/26/2023	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re settlement negotiations and trial	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		preparation Billed invoice 20230157	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
01/27/2023	4	Telephone calls with J. Rue and T. O'Leary re settlement negotiations Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
01/30/2023	4	Telephone calls with co-counsel re settlement negotiations (.5); conference with J. Rue and exchanging emails with co-counsel re new "second mediation" procedure at OAL and impact on settlement (1.1) Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.60h	\$585.00	-	\$936.00
01/31/2023	4	Telephone calls and conferences (5) with co-counsel re settlement negotiations (1.5); conferences with co-counsel and stakeholders re new procedures implemented at OAL (.4); telephone call with J. Valverde re trial prep and new "second mediation" form and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.6); telephone call with J. Rue re settlement negotiations and new OAL procedure (.3) Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,638.00
01/31/2023	4	"Conference among co-counsel re opening statement, dry run, and trial strategy	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20230157	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/01/2023	②	Multiple telephone conferences with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement negotiations (.7); reviewing and responding to emails from T. O'Leary re same (.1); drafting emails to J. Valverde and amici re new OAL form and reviewing responses (.1) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	_	\$526.50
02/01/2023	4	Exchanging emails with opposing counsel re revised monitoring report template, reviewing revised template, and telephone call with M. Lynch re same (.9); telephone calls with co-counsel re finalization of settlement (.5) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.40h	\$585.00	-	\$819.00
02/02/2023	②	Telephone call with amici and G. Little re second mediation form and settlement negotiations (.8); telephone calls and exchanging emails with J. Rue re same (1.2); telephone call with J. Valverde re settlement issues (.1); exchanging emails with Judge Schneider and J. Rue re phone call (.1) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,287.00
02/03/2023	4	Drafting email to and zoom call with C. Labin re new second mediation form (.9); telephone call	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		with J. Rue re follow-up to C. Labin phone call and next steps re settlement (.5); telephone call with Judge Schneider re fee mediation (.4); zoom call with co-counsel re mediation, approval of settlement, discussions with amici (1.3) Billed invoice 20230235	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/08/2023	4	Telephone call with C. Labin and drawing emails to J. Valverde and J. Rue re second mediation program Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
02/09/2023	②	Drafting emails to G. Little, J. Rue, J. Gran re meeting with amici and reviewing responses (.1); drafting email to J. Valverde re same (.1); telephone call with G. Little re preparation for meeting with amici (.2) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
02/13/2023	②	Reviewing letter from amici and preparing draft response Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	_	\$1,462.50
02/14/2023	4	Conference with J. Gran, G. Little, J. Rue re preparation for call with amici and revise draft response to correspondence from amici Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/15/2023	②	Conference with amici and co- counsel re settlement concerns (2.0); follow up conference with co- counsel (.5); telephone call with C. Latin and follow-up emails re posting of March 2020 procedural safeguards on internet and removal of posting (.5) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
02/16/2023	②	Review of near final settlement agreement, exchanging multiple emails with C. Labin re changes to correct errors in monitoring report template and change to web-based adjournment request report form, and revising monitoring report template Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,111.50
02/21/2023	4	Drafting 502(d) consent order (.3) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
02/22/2023	②	Meeting with amici, preparing for meeting, and follow-up meetings and phone calls with co-counsel Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,872.00
02/23/2023	4	Phone call with J. Valverde re amici concerns (.3); phone call with co-counsel and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same (1.0)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20230235	MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/24/2023	②	Telephone call with J. Valverde re amici concerns related to consent order (.3); conference with J. Rue re same (.5); telephone call with G. Little re same (.1) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$585.00	-	\$526.50
03/06/2023	4	Telephone call with G. Little and J. Valverde re settlement issues and drafting email to J. Rue re same (.6); telephone call with co-counsel re settlement issues (.6) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
03/07/2023	4	Telephone call with G. Little re settlement issues (.3); telephone call with J. Rue re same (.3); second telephone call with G. Little re settlement issues (.2); reviewing letter from J. Valverde and reviewing Agreement and summarizing data collection/ compliance measuring including example scenarios to illustrate how compliance monitoring works and drafting emails to co-counsel re same (5.2) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.00h	\$585.00	-	\$3,510.00
03/08/2023	4	Telephone calls with J. Rue, G. Little, and J. Wasserman re settlement issues and drafting emails to co-counsel re same (1.0); drafting email to C. Labin re	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.40h	\$585.00	-	\$3,744.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		settlement issues (.1); revising Settlement Agreement to correct scrivener's error and drafting emails to opposing counsel, co- counsel, and counsel for amici re same (1.0); reviewing letter from J. Valverde, responding to amici concerns, and participating in call with co-counsel re same (4.3) Billed invoice 20230394						
03/13/2023	4	Reviewing and revising correspondence to State in preparation for March 14 call re Consent Order (1.0); telephone call with plaintiffs' counsel re correspondence re Consent Order (1.5); telephone calls with G. Little, J. Rue, and J. Wasserman re same and drafting emails to G. Little re data collection (1.7) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.20h	\$585.00	-	\$2,457.00
03/14/2023	4	Reviewing and revising correspondence in response to amici's letter (1.3); conference with C. Labin, M. Lynch, and J. Wasserman re State's position on issues in correspondence (.5); telephone call with G. Little re correspondence (.3); exchanging emails with J. Wasserman and J. Rue re correspondence and revising updated draft (1.5) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.60h	\$585.00	-	\$2,106.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
03/15/2023	4	Reviewing and revising correspondence re settlement, telephone call with J. Valverde re same, telephone calls with cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
03/16/2023	4	Responding to email from C. Labin re additional documentation in excel (.3); conference with cocunsel re settlement issues (.7); conference with J. Rue re settlement notice and drafting settlement notice (2.1) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,813.50
03/20/2023	4	Attending NJSEP meeting re settlement and drafting email to J. Rue and J. Wasserman re same Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
03/20/2023	②	Drafting and revising proposed settlement notice Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
03/21/2023	4	Reviewing emails from C. Labin re changes to forms and drafting responses (.2); conference with J. Rue re NJSEP issues (.9); conference with J. Rue and J. Gran re potential intervenors/monitors (.5); drafting email and text to J. Valverde re revised	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,053.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		adjournment request form and reviewing response (.1); revising adjournment request form (.1) Billed invoice 20230394						
03/29/2023	②	Reviewing amici suggestions re Adjournment Request Form and drafting email to J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
03/29/2023	4	Telephone call with Judge Schneider re fee mediation, follow up phone call with J. Rue, and drafting and reviewing emails re same Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
03/30/2023	4	Drafting proposed notice of settlement and exchanging emails with J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	7.50h	\$585.00	-	\$4,387.50
04/06/2023	②	Exchanging emails with J. Rue re requests from amici and adjournment request form (.1) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
04/06/2023	②	Zoom call with D. Giles and J. Rue re class notice (.5); zoom call with J. Rue re class counsel issues, potential co-class counsel arrangements (.5) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
04/13/2023	a	Telephone call with J. Rue re	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
04/12/2023	4	Reviewing NJDOE changes to Adjournment Request Form and exchanging emails with J. Rue and D. Giles re same Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
04/12/2023	4	Reviewing email from J. Rue re fee negotiations Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
04/11/2023	②	Reviewing order from Court re status update and drafting email to co-counsel re same (.1) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
04/10/2023	②	Revising settlement notice and drafting email to J. Rue and D. Giles re same (.5); reviewing email from D. Giles and revising settlement notice language re waiver/release and drafting email to J. Rue and D. Giles re same (.6) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
04/07/2023	②	Zoom call with co-counsel re additional class counsel (.4); telephone call with J. Gran re same (.2); telephone call with G. Little re same (.1); reviewing and revising settlement notice (1.0) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.70h	\$585.00	-	\$994.50
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		settlement notice (.1); drafting email to J. Gran, J. Rue, and G. Little re potential monitors (.1) Billed invoice 20230479	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
04/13/2023	②	Telephone call with D. Giles and J. Rue re adjournment request form and drafting email to C. Labin re same Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
04/14/2023	4	Telephone call with Judge Schneider re negotiations Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
04/18/2023	②	Drafting and sending emails to potential monitors and exchanging emails with J. Gran and J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
04/19/2023	4	Reviewing letter from Amici re settlement notice and exchanging emails with J. Rue and G. Little re same Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
04/20/2023	4	Drafting email to J. Rue, J. Gran, and G. Little re scheduling interviews for monitor and potential interview questions Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
04/21/2023	②	Drafting email to S. Almazan, J. Rue, J. Gran re scheduling monitor interviews Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
04/21/2023	②	Drafting co-class counsel agreement and third amended fee sharing agreement Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
05/02/2023	4	Conducting legal research re approval of attorney's fees in class actions and timing of motions for preliminary and final approval and drafting email to J. Rue and G. Little re same Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
05/03/2023	4	Zoom calls with J. Rue and D. Giles re revision of draft settlement notice (2.0); revising draft settlement notice in preparation for zoom calls based on input from amici (2.3) Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.30h	\$585.00	-	\$2,515.50
05/05/2023	②	Telephone call with G. Little and J. Rue re settlement notice, fairness hearing issues (.3); conducting legal research re timing of fairness hearing (1.3); drafting communication to J. Rue re research (.2) Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,053.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
05/08/2023	4	Zoom call with NJDOE counsel re settlement notice and follow-up email to NJDOE counsel re requirements for notice and reviewing response Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
05/08/2023	•	Conducting legal research re notice requirements for (b)(2) and (b)(3) class action settlements Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$585.00	-	\$468.00
05/09/2023	•	Participating in Zoom interview with J. Hess (potential monitor) and in follow-up meeting with J. Gran, J. Rue, S. Almazan Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.30h	\$585.00	-	\$760.50
05/09/2023	•	Exchanging emails with D. Giles, J. Rue, J. Gran re notice to 23(b)(2) class members on transmittal notice Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
05/17/2023	•	Conducting legal research re motion for preliminary and final approval and drafting email to J. Rue re same (2.3); exchanging emails with C. Labin re status of notice (.1) Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
05/19/2023	4	Zoom calls with potential monitors (E. Hill, M. Mlawer, and J. Elliott) (2.8); conferences with J. Gran, S.	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,930.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Almazan, and J. Rue re recommendations of potential monitors (.5) Billed invoice 20230610	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
05/24/2023	②	Zoom call with D. Soutar and J. Rue re revisions to class notice Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
05/25/2023	②	Reviewing and revising brief in support of motion for preliminary approval and drafting email to cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$585.00	-	\$292.50
06/07/2023	②	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re state's response to M. Mlawer and state's proposed monitor Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
06/18/2023	•	Reviewing notes from status conference, exchanging emails with J. Rue re required amendments to stipulation and notice and drafting/revising amended stipulation and amended certification of J. Rue Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
06/19/2023	②	Revising Stipulation and Amended Certification and exhibits and drafting email to J. Rue re same Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
06/20/2023	②	Exchanging emails with J. Rue re stipulation nan amended certification (.1); exchanging emails with J. Rue re confidentiality provision/attorneys designated for compliance monitoring and potential revision at State's request (.1) Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
06/22/2023	4	Reviewing stipulation and amended certification and drafting email to C. Labin, M. Lynch, and J. Rue re same (.3); telephone call with J. Rue re same (.1) Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
06/22/2023	4	Zoom call with J. Rue, C. Labin, M. Lynch re amended certification and stipulation Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
07/11/2023	4	Travel to/from and attendance at hearing in federal court Billed invoice 20230903	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
07/17/2023	4	Telephone call with J. Valverde re addressing amici's concerns related to settlement (.5); reviewing amici concerns and incorporating into proposed revised consent	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		order (2.5) Billed invoice 20230903						
07/22/2023	②	Revising Settlement Agreement to address concerns of Amici Billed invoice 20230903	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,170.00
08/10/2023	4	Revising long form notice to address amici concerns Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.00h	\$585.00	-	\$1,755.00
08/11/2023	4	Revising long form notice to address amici concerns Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
08/28/2023	•	Reviewing email from D. Dwyer re Class Counsel Plan and revisions to Consent Order and Settlement Agreement (.2); telephone call with J. Valverde (.2); reviewing Amici requests re agreement (.7); drafting email to J. Valverde re same (.4) Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
09/04/2023	4	Telephone calls with J. Valverde re revisions to Settlement Agreement (.5); reviewing suggested changes, revising Agreement (1.9); drafting email to J. Valverde re same (.3)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.70h	\$585.00	-	\$1,579.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20231186						
09/05/2023	②	Telephone call with J. Valverde re Amici's requested changes to agreement and reviewing agreement Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
09/10/2023	②	Reviewing and revising Consent Order and Settlement Agreement, email to C. Labin and M. Lynch, and telephone conferences with J. Valverde re same Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
09/19/2023	•	Revising notice and drafting email to D. Giles and J. Valverde re same Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
09/20/2023	•	Exchanging emails with S. Almazan and J. Gran re compliance monitor interviews and drafting email to L. Knutdson re same Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
09/21/2023	•	Telephone conference with C. Labin and M. Lynch re class counsel plan and settlement negotiations (.9); telephone call with J. Valverde re same (.2); drafting email to Class Counsel team re same (.1) Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$585.00	-	\$702.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
10/13/2023	4	Drafting letter to Court re motion hearing Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
10/04/2023	②	Reviewing revisions from co- counsel to reply in support of class counsel plan and drafting responsive emails Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
10/03/2023	②	Reviewing opposition to motion for appointment as class counsel, conducting legal research, drafting reply, and drafting emails to cocounsel and reviewing responses re same Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	-	\$1,345.50
09/28/2023	(Zoom conference with J. Valverde re revisions to settlement (.5); zoom conference with J. Valverde, C. Labin, D. Giles re revisions to settlement (2.0) Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.50h	\$585.00	-	\$1,462.50
09/27/2023	②	Telephone call with L. Knudtson (1.1); drafting email to counsel team re compliance monitor Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
09/26/2023	②	Drafting email to opposing counsel re status of changes to settlement agreement Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
10/15/2023	•	Reviewing and revising most recent version of settlement agreement, drafting questions for NJDOE re outstanding issues, and drafting email to J. Valverde and D. Giles re same Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.30h	\$585.00	<u>-</u>	\$1,345.50
10/16/2023	②	Attending motion hearing by telephone (1.8); reviewing settlement agreement and zoom conference with C. Labin re changes based on phone call with monitor (1.0); drafting email to cocounsel re motion hearing and status of settlement negotiations (.9) Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	3.70h	\$585.00	-	\$2,164.50
10/26/2023	②	Reviewing changes to settlement agreement, drafting chart of changes (1.6); drafting emails to co-counsel (.3); telephone calls with co-counsel (.3) Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.20h	\$585.00	-	\$1,287.00
10/29/2023	4	Telephone call with J. Valverde re settlement agreement and reviewing outstanding issues Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
10/30/2023	a	Zoom call with C. Labin, M. Lynch,	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	4.00h	\$585.00	-	\$2,340.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		J. Valverde re settlement agreement (2.8); telephone call with G. Little re same (.2); drafting email to co-class counsel re same (.3); reviewing email from J. Valverde re 45-day timeline for district-filed complaints and drafting response email and drafting email to M. Lynch and C. Labin re same (.5); conducting legal research re mediation timelines (.2) Billed invoice 20231356	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
11/01/2023	•	Participating in zoom call with class counsel team re settlement and approval process (1.3); drafting email to J. Wasserman re motion for preliminary approval (.1); drafting email to R. Thurston re motion for final approval (.1) Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$585.00	-	\$877.50
11/06/2023	•	Drafting email to M. Lynch re follow-up to Friday's meeting and court filings and reviewing response (.1); zoom call with R. Kim, J. Levin, E. Athos, G. Little re court filings pursuant to Court's Oct 27, 2023 Order (.9); zoom call with M. Lynch re settlement agreement (.3); finalizing email to J. Valverde re settlement and telephone call with J. Valverde re same (.5); drafting email to M. Lynch re statement to Court (.1); drafting email to M. Lynch re revisions to	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$585.00	-	\$1,404.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Statement to be filed re ELC and minor revisions to Agreement (2); filing Certification and Statement and drafting email to E. Athos, J. Levin, R. Kim, and G. Little re same (.1) Billed invoice 20231535 Telephone call with J. Valverde re amici review of potential settlement (.1); drafting email to M. Lynch re same (.3) Billed invoice 20231535 Billed invoice 20231535 Travel to/from and attending status conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same (.3) Billed invoice 20231535 Billed invoice 20231535 Provided to Conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same (.3) Revising email to M. Lynch re rejuest for change to settlement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 Billed invoice 20231535 Difect 2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Merino Reisman Difect 2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Merino Reisman Difect 2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Department of Educatio	Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
Statement to be filed re ELC and minor revisions to Agreement (.2); filing Certification and Statement and drafting email to E. Athos, J. Levin, R. Kim, and G. Little re same (.1) Billed invoice 20231535 Telephone call with J. Valverde re amici review of potential settlement (.1); drafting non-substantive revisions to Agreement and drafting email to M. Lynch re same (.3) Billed invoice 20231535 Travel to/from and attending status conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231535 Revising email from R. Thurston re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement by JRA Revising notice for readability and efaffing email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Revising notice for readability and afaffing email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Revising notice 20231535 Revising notice for readability and afaffing email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Revising notice 20231535 Revising notice for readability and afaffing email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Merino Reisman Marino Reisman Amerino Reisman Catherine 1.00h \$585.00 Catherine 1.10h \$585.00 Catherine			revising Agreement (.5)						
amicl review of potential settlement (.1), drafting non-substantive revisions to Agreement and drafting email to M. Lynch re same (.3) Billed invoice 20231535 Travel to/from and attending status conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231535 Travel to/from and attending status conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231535 Reviewing email from R. Thurston re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 Billed invoice 20231535 Reviewing email from R. Thurston re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 Billed invoice 20231535 Catherine N. N.J. Catherine N. Thurston C. P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Catherine Neisman Catherine N. 10h \$585.00 Catherine N. Source Neisman Merino Reisman 1.00h \$585.00 Catherine N. Source N. So	11/08/2023	•	Statement to be filed re ELC and minor revisions to Agreement (.2); filing Certification and Statement and drafting email to E. Athos, J. Levin, R. Kim, and G. Little re same (.1)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	0.30h	\$585.00	-	\$175.50
conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231535 11/17/2023 Reviewing email from R. Thurston re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 11/20/2023 Reviewing email from R. Thurston re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 Belied invoice 20231535 11/20/2023 Revising notice for readability and drafting email to J. Valverde re Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Revising notice for readability and drafting email to J. Valverde re Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Catherine Merino Reisman C.P., et al. v. N.J. Merino Reisman Session Catherine Merino Catherine Merino Catherine Merino 1.10h \$585.00 - \$643 Merino 1.354.00h	11/09/2023	②	amici review of potential settlement (.1); drafting non-substantive revisions to Agreement and drafting email to M. Lynch re same (.3)	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	0.40h	\$585.00	-	\$234.00
re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA Billed invoice 20231535 Revising notice for readability and drafting email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS (D.N.J.) Catherine 1.10h \$585.00 - \$643 (D.N.J.) 1,354.00h \$0.00 \$792,48	11/15/2023	②	conference in Camden and drafting email update to co-counsel re same	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	1.00h	\$585.00	-	\$585.00
drafting email to J. Valverde re C.P., et al. v. N.J. Merino 1,354.00h \$0.00 \$792,49	11/17/2023	②	re status conference and drafting email to M. Lynch re request for change to settlement agreement by JRA	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Merino	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
,	11/20/2023	4	,	•		1.10h	\$585.00	-	\$643.50
0.0011 1,33-						1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.0 0 1,354.00h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		same Billed invoice 20231535	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
11/27/2023	②	Drafting email to J. Valverde re draft Notice Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
11/28/2023	②	Exchanging emails with M. Lynch re paperwork required for incentive payments for named plaintiffs Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
11/29/2023	②	Reviewing and revising class notice, telephone call with M. Lynch re same, drafting email to M. Lynch re same (.3); reviewing email from R. Thurston re revision to class notice (.1); drafting and revising motion for preliminary approval and drafting email to J. Wasserman re same (2.5) Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.90h	\$585.00	-	\$1,696.50
11/30/2023	4	Reviewing email from K. Rue re meeting with named plaintiffs, drafting email to co-counsel re same, and reviewing responses Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
12/04/2023	a	Drafting email to co-counsel re schedule for final approval and reviewing responses (.1); drafting	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	4.50h	\$585.00	-	\$2,632.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		letter to C.P. re update on class counsel (.1); responding to email from K. Rue re inquiries from named plaintiffs re revised settlement agreement (.1); conducting legal research re CAFA and exchanging emails with M. Lynch re same (.9); zoom call with and exchanging emails with cocounsel re upcoming status conference and status of settlement approval (.8); telephone conference with M. Lynch re request to adjourn Thursday hearing and follow-up email with co-counsel re same, drafting follow-up email to M. Lynch re same (.4); reviewing and revising draft memo of law in support of preliminary approval, conducting legal research re same, and reviewing and revising proposed Order, drafting email to M. Lynch re same (2.1) Billed invoice 20240007	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
12/05/2023	•	Reviewing and revising memo of law in support of motion for preliminary approval and declaration of C. Reisman in support of motion (2.0); reviewing email from M. Lynch re Thursday hearing date and reviewing letter from K. Rue re same (.1) Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,228.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/06/2023	4	Telephone call with M. Lynch re motion for preliminary approval and status conference (.1); drafting email to co-counsel re same (.1); reviewing and revising declaration, notice, memo of law and drafting email to M. Lynch about approval of notice (.5) Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.70h	\$585.00	-	\$409.50
12/11/2023	•	Final revisions to and filing motion for preliminary approval and exchanging emails with M. Lynch and co-counsel re same (.5); drafting email to named plaintiffs re motion for preliminary approval (.1) Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.60h	\$585.00	-	\$351.00
12/14/2023	•	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re correspondence from J. Epstein Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
12/18/2023	•	Travel to/from and attendance at hearing on unopposed motion for preliminary approval (2.0); drafting email to L. Knudtson re preliminary approval (.1) Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$585.00	-	\$1,228.50
12/19/2023	2	Drafting email update to named plaintiffs and to co-counsel Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.10h	\$585.00	-	\$58.50
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h
01/15/2024	4	Conducting legal research and exchanging emails with co-counsel	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	0.30h	\$600.00	-	\$180.00
01/12/2024	4	Exchanging emails with co-counsel re CAFA deadlines Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.30h	\$600.00	-	\$180.00
01/10/2024	4	Reviewing and revising proposed stipulated rates and exchanging emails with R. Thurston re same (.8); drafting email to M. Lynch re sending out notice (.1) Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$600.00	-	\$540.00
01/09/2024	4	Drafting and sending out CAFA notice to additional AGs identified by defendants Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$600.00	-	\$480.00
12/26/2023	4	Gathering documents to be sent with CAFA notices to USDOJ and PA AG's office, exchanging texts with M. Lynch re same, and drafting CAFA letter notifying USDOJ and PA AG's office of settlement Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.80h	\$585.00	-	\$1,053.00
12/19/2023	4	Reviewing final notice and drafting email to M. Lynch and co-counsel re final notice for dissemination Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$585.00	-	\$117.00
Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		re CAFA Billed invoice 20240119	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
01/18/2024	•	Telephone call with M. Lynch re notice issues, re-working approval schedule and hourly rates (.3); exchanging emails with M. Lynch re notice and notifying court (.1); exchanging emails with co-counsel re notice situation (.1) Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.50h	\$600.00	<u>-</u>	\$300.00
01/19/2024	•	Telephone call with M. Lynch re notice and CAFA issues Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.20h	\$600.00	-	\$120.00
01/22/2024	•	Telephone call with M. Lynch re notice, revising schedule, and consent order and exchanging emails with co-counsel re same (.4); drafting and revising proposed Consent Order and exchanging emails with co-counsel and M. Lynch re same (.8) Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.20h	\$600.00	-	\$720.00
01/23/2024	②	Reviewing broadcast memo re new policies and drafting email to M. Lynch re same, exchanging emails with co-counsel re same, and finalizing email to M. Lynch (.5); telephone call with M. Lynch re policy changes and notice to class	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$600.00	-	\$540.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		(.4) Billed invoice 20240119						
01/29/2024	②	Drafting emails to M. Lynch re notice and revised procedures and exchanging emails with class counsel team re same (.6); drafting emails to D. Giles and R. Thurston re petition or attorneys fees and telephone call with D. Giles re same (.2) Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$600.00	-	\$480.00
01/30/2024	•	Reviewing and responding to email from D. Giles re fee petition (.1); drafting stipulation re hourly rates and drafting email to T. Tilton re same (.2); telephone call with M. Lynch re notice and policy/procedure amendments (.2); drafting email to co-counsel re same (.3) Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.80h	\$600.00	-	\$480.00
02/01/2024	•	Drafting messages to M. Lynch re notice issues (.1); drafting letter to court and exchanging emails with co-counsel re letter re notice issues, filing letter (.3); telephone call with M. Lynch re notice issues (.3); reviewing and responding to email from K. Rue re notice issues (.2) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.90h	\$600.00	-	\$540.00
02/02/2024	a	Exchanging emails/text messages	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	0.50h	\$600.00	-	\$300.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		with M. Lynch re consent order (.2); revising notice based on entry of consent order and drafting email/text message to M. Lynch re same (.2); exchanging emails with co-counsel re revised consent order (.1) Billed invoice 20240313	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
02/05/2024	4	Responding to email from S.S. re receipt of notice, drafting email to named plaintiffs re change in schedule, and drafting email to cocounsel re same Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$600.00	-	\$240.00
02/07/2024	4	Drafting follow-up emails to M. Lynch and class counsel team re new policies/procedures and response to USDOE and reviewing response from team (.3); exchanging emails with co-counsel re certification from JRA for attorney's fees motion (.1) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	0.40h	\$600.00	-	\$240.00
02/15/2024	•	Telephone call with M. Lynch, exchanging emails with class counsel, drafting correspondence to Court re email notice to attorneys (1.0); drafting email to M. Lynch re letter to court, reviewing response, drafting and filing letter to court (.5) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$600.00	-	\$900.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/20/2024	•	Reviewing and responding to inquiries from class members (3.0); reviewing objection from J. Epstein, exchanging emails with M. Lynch and drafting email to class counsel re same (.3); reviewing responses from class counsel (.1); conducting legal research re objections and drafting email to class counsel re same (2.1); telephone call with class member K.B. re inquiries regarding the class action (.5) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	6.00h	\$600.00		\$3,600.00
02/23/2024	•	Preparing for and attending NJSEP meeting regarding settlement terms (1.0); reviewing and responding to class member inquiries and telephone calls with class members (1.4) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.40h	\$600.00	-	\$1,440.00
02/26/2024	•	Responding to emails and telephone calls from class members Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.60h	\$600.00	-	\$960.00
02/27/2024	•	Reviewing and responding to emails from class members (2.0); telephone call with G. Little re fairness hearing (.1) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	2.10h	\$600.00	-	\$1,260.00
02/28/2024	4	Conducting legal research for	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	3.00h	\$600.00	-	\$1,800.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 140 of 162 PageID: 16683

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		motion for attorney's fees, drafting stipulation re hourly rates, and drafting/revising memo of law in support of final approval Billed invoice 20240313	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
02/29/2024	•	Reviewing and revising stipulation re hourly rates, exchanging emails with J. Wasserman re same, drafting email to class counsel team re same (1.0); telephone call with M. Lynch re policies issue, objections and opt-outs, and documentation needed for payment (.5) Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.50h	\$600.00	-	\$900.00
					1,354.00h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$792,495.00 1,354.00h

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
04/03/2020	②	Conference among plaintiffs' counsel Billed invoice 20200344	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.80h	\$610.00	-	\$488.00
06/24/2020	•	Analyze draft discovery plan (0.1); conference call among counsel re discovery plan and Rule 16 conference (1.0); suggest edits to letter to defendants re expedited trial (0.2) Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.30h	\$610.00	-	\$793.00
09/21/2020	o	Review correspondence re interlocutory appeal Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.10h	\$610.00	-	\$61.00
09/22/2020	②	Review correspondence re conference call Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.10h	\$610.00	-	\$61.00
09/24/2020	o	Review draft reply brief on consolidation Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
09/25/2020	0	Review draft discovery requests Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.20h	\$610.00	-	\$122.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
12/11/2020	4	Review correspondence re conference call (.1); review proposal 26(f) report from Kerry Serrano (.1) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.20h	\$610.00	-	\$122.00
12/12/2020	4	Conference among counsel re 26(f) conference (1.0); review chart re 26(f) report (.1) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.20h	\$610.00	-	\$732.00
12/13/2020	4	Review ESI protocol Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
03/22/2021	4	Drafting correspondence to counsel team re training of ALJs Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
09/13/2021	②	Conference with John Rue and Saraya Sikora re motion for class certification Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.60h	\$610.00	-	\$366.00
09/14/2021	4	Telephone conference with C. Reisman re remedy Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h
09/22/2021	4	Analyze SAC and edit brief in	01664.2020-Perry	Judith Gran	4.00h	\$610.00		\$2,440.00
09/21/2021	②	Create ShareFile account and review contents of ShareFile NJ 45 Day site Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.60h	\$610.00	-	\$366.00
09/21/2021	②	Research for class cert motion Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.70h	\$610.00	-	\$427.00
09/20/2021	②	Research on class cert (2.0); draft brief in support of class cert. Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.60h	\$610.00	-	\$1,586.00
09/19/2021	②	Research caselaw on class certification Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	6.30h	\$610.00	-	\$3,843.00
09/17/2021	②	Research for brief on class certification Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.90h	\$610.00	-	\$1,769.00
09/16/2021	②	Analyze brief on class cert. previously filed Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.70h	\$610.00	-	\$427.00
Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		support of class cert. Billed invoice 20210759	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
09/23/2021	4	Review materials on Sharepoint site (0.3); research and draft brief on class certification (2.4) Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.70h	\$610.00	-	\$1,647.00
09/26/2021	4	Corr. John Rue and Catherine re class cert brief (0.1); draft class cert brief Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.10h	\$610.00	-	\$61.00
09/27/2021	4	Corr. John Rue and Catherine re class cert brief (0.1); draft class cert brief Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.50h	\$610.00	-	\$915.00
09/29/2021	②	Draft brief in support of class certification Billed invoice 20210759	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.70h	\$610.00	-	\$1,037.00
10/04/2021	②	Draft brief in support of class cert Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	10.80h	\$610.00	-	\$6,588.00
10/05/2021	4	Draft brief in support of class certification	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Judith Gran	1.20h	\$610.00	-	\$732.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20210838	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
11/18/2021	•	Correspondence to J. Rue and C. Reisman re brief in support of class certification Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.10h	\$610.00	-	\$61.00
12/22/2021	4	Corr. counsel team re remote hearings Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.20h	\$610.00	-	\$122.00
01/13/2022	②	Drafting email to C. Reisman re remedial order (0.1); review comments from team on Zoom call (0.1); Drafting email to C. Reisman re remedial orders in Arlington litigation and alternative strategies to present to Court (0.3) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.50h	\$610.00	-	\$305.00
01/31/2023	4	Conference among counsel re opening statement, "dry run" and trial strategy Billed invoice 20230157	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.70h	\$610.00	-	\$1,037.00
02/01/2023	4	Call from CMR re settlement issues; analyze draft settlement Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.40h	\$610.00	-	\$244.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

		Billed invoice 20230235	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-		77.10h		\$0.00	\$47,075.00
02/21/2023	4	Prepare for meeting with amici re settlement agreement.	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Judith Gran	0.60h	\$610.00	-	\$366.00
02/17/2023	②	Review correspondence from cocunsel re finalization of settlement Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.10h	\$610.00	-	\$61.00
02/16/2023	②	Research IDEA requirements on parental input into procedures (0.4); corr. CMR and JR re amici's positions (0.6) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.00h	\$610.00	-	\$610.00
02/15/2023	•	Conference with amici re issues in settlement agreement (2.0); conference and correspondence with co-counsel and analyze agreements in Charlie H. (1.0) Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	3.00h	\$610.00	-	\$1,830.00
02/14/2023	•	Conference with John Rue, CMR, Greg L. re: preparation for meeting with amici representatives and review revised response to questions Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.00h	\$610.00	-	\$1,220.00
02/13/2023	4	Analyze letter from J. Valvorde re proposed settlement agreement and corr. co-counsel; prepare for meetings concerning settlement. Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.00h	\$610.00	-	\$1,220.00
Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
02/22/2023	②	Conference amici re settlement agreement and preparation Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.60h	\$610.00	-	\$1,586.00
03/07/2023	2	Corr. John Rue and CMR re approval of settlement - issues and next steps and review Messier memo Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
03/24/2023	4	Corr. co-counsel re NJSEP Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.50h	\$610.00	-	\$305.00
03/26/2023	0	Analysis of case law in DNJ and Third Circuit on fairness and intervention by objectors (1.1); corr John Rue re settlement approval (0.5). Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.60h	\$610.00	-	\$976.00
03/26/2023	4	Corr. Catherine Reisman re outstanding issues. Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.90h	\$610.00	-	\$549.00
04/07/2023	4	Conference with co-counsel re adding parties, preparing for implementation; conf CMR	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Judith Gran	0.90h	\$610.00	-	\$549.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20230479	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
04/14/2023	②	Corr. co-counsel re candidates for monitor; research potential candidates Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.80h	\$610.00	-	\$488.00
04/17/2023	②	Corr. court monitor selection committee re candidates; research candidates Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.00h	\$610.00	-	\$610.00
04/18/2023	②	Review CV and other information on web about Michael Rebell as potential candidate for monitor (0.5); review corr. to potential candidates for monitor and corr. CMR and JR (0.2); draft material for interviewing monitor (0.3) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.00h	\$610.00	-	\$610.00
04/26/2023	②	Conference with Selene Almazan, CMR, JR re candidates for monitor. Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.50h	\$610.00	-	\$305.00
05/05/2023	•	Conference call with CMR re developments concerning settlement Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.50h	\$610.00	-	\$305.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
06/18/2023	4	Call among counsel Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.30h	\$610.00	-	\$793.00
08/08/2023	4	Corr. and conference with cocounsel re response to Rue filing and analyze filing Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.90h	\$610.00	-	\$549.00
08/16/2023	②	Corr. among counsel re: resolution of motion for clarification, settlement approval Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
08/17/2023	②	Analyze JRA proposed order and corr.co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.30h	\$610.00	-	\$183.00
08/21/2023	②	Conference with co-counsel in preparation for status conference. Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.30h	\$610.00	-	\$793.00
08/23/2023	4	Conference among co-counsel re rule to show cause and communications from JRA and mediator; corr. among co-counsel Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.00h	\$610.00	-	\$610.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
08/24/2023	o	Review draft implementation plan and suggest additions; conference with CMR and co-counsel re plan and next steps Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.20h	\$610.00	-	\$732.00
09/12/2023	②	Conference call among plaintiffs' counsel Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.50h	\$610.00	-	\$305.00
09/13/2023	②	Corr. plaintiffs' counsel Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.20h	\$610.00	-	\$122.00
09/27/2023	②	Interview L. Knudtsen for court monitor position and conference with interview team Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.20h	\$610.00	-	\$732.00
10/04/2023	②	Review draft reply brief and corr. co-counsel re same Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	0.20h	\$610.00	-	\$122.00
10/16/2023	②	Oral argument on motion to substitute class counsel; confernce with counsel; travel to/from courthouse Billed invoice 20231356	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	2.80h	\$610.00	-	\$1,708.00
					77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Activities Export

Date	•	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/16/20)24	②	Conference among co-counsel re preparation for fairness hearing Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.00h	\$630.00	-	\$630.00
02/21/20)24	②	Conference with co-counsel re objections and inquiries about settlement and fairness hearing Billed invoice 20240313	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Judith Gran	1.20h	\$630.00	-	\$756.00
						77.10h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$47,075.00 77.10h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 152 of 162 PageID: 16695

Activities Export

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
01/11/2022	4	Preparing billing activity reports Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	0.50h	\$125.00	-	\$62.50
01/18/2022	4	Preparing joint exhibits for PTO Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	3.50h	\$125.00	-	\$437.50
01/19/2022	4	Preparing petitioner's exhibits for PTO Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	2.00h	\$125.00	-	\$250.00
09/20/2022	4	Comparing list of stipulated exhibits against list of contested exhibits Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	0.50h	\$125.00	-	\$62.50
02/06/2023	•	Preparing billing graphs for certification report Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	1.30h	\$125.00	-	\$162.50
01/30/2024	4	Updating attorney information chart on the Stipulation of hourly rates Billed invoice 20240119	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Tina Tilton	0.80h	\$125.00	-	\$100.00
					8.60h		\$0.00 0.00h	\$1,075.00 8.60h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 153 of 162 PageID: 16696

Activities Export

Date 4	_ T	уре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
11/17/2021		4	Organizing exhibits for class certification Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Connie Tracey	3.00h	\$125.00	-	\$375.00
12/05/2023	(②	Preparing TOC and TOA for memorandum of law to be filed 12.8.2023 Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Connie Tracey	1.40h	\$125.00	-	\$175.00
						4.40h		\$0.00 0.00h	•

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 154 of 162 PageID: 16697

Activities Export

							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h
08/31/2020	\$	Legal Research (August 2020)	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	1.00	\$35.51	-	\$35.51
07/31/2020	\$	Legal Research (July 2020) Billed invoice 20200574	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$69.02	-	\$69.02
06/30/2020	\$	Legal Research (June 2020) Billed invoice 20200491	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$131.56	-	\$131.56
03/31/2020	\$	Legal Research (March 2020) Billed invoice 20200227	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$51.45	-	\$51.45
12/31/2019	\$	Legal Research (December 2019) Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$3.56	-	\$3.56
11/30/2019	\$	Legal Research (November 2019) Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$85.99	-	\$85.99
10/31/2019	\$	Legal Research (October 2019) Billed invoice 20200369	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$18.32	-	\$18.32
Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)

Date 🔺	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20200679	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
12/31/2020	\$	Legal Research (December 2020) Billed invoice 20210018	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$23.03	-	\$23.03
02/28/2021	\$	Legal Research (February 2021) Billed invoice 20210170	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$3.30	-	\$3.30
03/31/2021	\$	Legal Research (March 2021) Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$189.50	-	\$189.50
06/30/2021	\$	Legal Research (June 2021) Billed invoice 20210501	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$3.00	-	\$3.00
07/31/2021	\$	Legal Research (July 2021) Billed invoice 20210597	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$23.92	-	\$23.92
09/30/2021	\$	Legal Research (August and September 2021)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	1.00	\$332.54	-	\$332.54
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20210759	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
10/31/2021	\$	Legal Research (October 2021) Billed invoice 20210838	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$56.08	-	\$56.08
11/30/2021	\$	Legal Research (November 2021) Billed invoice 20210905	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$101.32	-	\$101.32
12/31/2021	\$	Legal Research (December 2021) Billed invoice 20220025	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$315.28	-	\$315.28
01/31/2022	\$	Legal Research (January 2022) Billed invoice 20220083	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$170.83	-	\$170.83
02/28/2022	\$	Legal Research (February 2022) Billed invoice 20220138	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$251.61	-	\$251.61
03/01/2022	\$	Meals (February 14, 2022 meeting) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$75.99	-	\$75.99
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
03/31/2022	\$	Legal Research (March 2022) Billed invoice 20220223	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$157.22	-	\$157.22
04/30/2022	\$	Legal Research (April 2022) Billed invoice 20220302	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$209.80	-	\$209.80
06/09/2022	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse Billed invoice 20220489	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$8.35	-	\$8.35
08/31/2022	\$	Legal Research (August 2022) Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$124.16	-	\$124.16
08/31/2022	\$	Parking fee- Hamilton Station Billed invoice 20220648	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$8.00	-	\$8.00
09/06/2022	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$11.05	-	\$11.05
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date _	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
			MJS (D.N.J.)					
09/30/2022	\$	Legal Research (September 2022) Billed invoice 20220760	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$560.46	_	\$560.46
10/31/2022	\$	Legal Research (October 2022) Billed invoice 20220904	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$83.07	-	\$83.07
11/01/2022	\$	Meals (September 26, 2022 meeting) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$13.85	-	\$13.85
11/02/2022	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$11.00	-	\$11.00
11/30/2022	\$	Legal Research (November 2022) Billed invoice 20221042	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$243.51	-	\$243.51
12/31/2022	\$	Legal Research (December 2022) Billed invoice 20230030	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$176.43	-	\$176.43
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date 🔺	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
02/28/2023	\$	Legal Research Billed invoice 20230235	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$136.77	-	\$136.77
03/31/2023	\$	Legal Research (March 2023) Billed invoice 20230394	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$162.37	-	\$162.37
04/30/2023	\$	Legal Research (April 2023) Billed invoice 20230479	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$54.69	-	\$54.69
05/31/2023	\$	Legal Research (May 2023) Billed invoice 20230610	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$403.55	-	\$403.55
06/30/2023	\$	Legal Research (June 2023) Billed invoice 20230756	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$35.71	-	\$35.71
07/10/2023	\$	Hand deliver courtesy copy of the Motion filed today to Judge Hillman Billed invoice 20230903	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$35.00	-	\$35.00
07/11/2023	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse	01664.2020-Perry	Catherine	1.00	\$10.00	-	\$10.00
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20230903	C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Merino Reisman				
07/31/2023	\$	Legal Research (July 2023) Billed invoice 20230903	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$214.70	-	\$214.70
08/01/2023	\$	Hand deliver courtesy copies of brief and supporting documents filed today to Judge Hillman on 7.24.23 Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$35.00	-	\$35.00
08/04/2023	\$	Fee for transcript of 7.11.23 hearing before Judge Hillman Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$42.00	-	\$42.00
08/22/2023	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse Billed invoice 20231089	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$11.99	-	\$11.99
09/11/2023	\$	Hand Delivery of settlement agreement to Judge Hillman Billed invoice 20231186	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$35.00	-	\$35.00
09/30/2023	\$	Legal Research (September 2023)	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J.	Catherine Merino	1.00	\$46.58	-	\$46.58
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Date _	Type	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		Billed invoice 20231186	Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Reisman				
11/01/2023	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse on 9.28.23 Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$2.50	-	\$2.50
11/03/2023	\$	Fee for transcript of 10.16.23 hearing before Judge Hillman Billed invoice 20231535	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$76.95	-	\$76.95
12/01/2023	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse on 11.15.23 Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$10.99	-	\$10.99
12/12/2023	\$	Hand delivery to Judge Hillman - ECF 546 (courtesy copy) Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$35.00	-	\$35.00
12/18/2023	\$	Parking fee- Camden Courthouse on 12.18.23 Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$2.85	-	\$2.85
12/26/2023	\$	Sending documents to The Honorable Michelle A. Henry, Attorney General of Pennsylvania	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education,	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$22.76	-	\$22.76
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h

Case 1:19-cv-12807-NLH-MJS Document 564-4 Filed 03/11/24 Page 162 of 162 PageID: 16705

Activities Export

Date •	Туре	Description	Matter	User	Qty	Rate (\$)	Non-billable (\$)	Billable (\$)
		via Fed Ex Billed invoice 20240007	No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)					
12/26/2023	\$	Sending documents to The Honorable Merrick Garland, U.S. Department of Justice via Fed Ex Billed invoice 20240007	01664.2020-Perry C.P., et al. v. N.J. Department of Education, No. 1:19-cv-12807-NLH- MJS (D.N.J.)	Catherine Merino Reisman	1.00	\$22.76	-	\$22.76
							\$0.00 0.00h	\$4,945.88 0.00h